Agenda
Village of Glen Ellyn
Building Board of Appeals Meeting
Wednesday, June 15, 2022
7:00 PM
Police Department Community Room
65 S. Park Boulevard, Glen Ellyn

CcC:

Call to Order: 7:00 p.m.

Roll Call

Public Comments (Non-agenda Items)
Approval of Draft Minutes

1) Minutes, Regular Meeting — 5/18/22
Old Business

New Business

1) Review of codes regulating construction for potential adoption
Trustee Report

Chairman’s Report

Staff Liaison’s Report

Next Meeting Date: TBD

Adjournment

Building Board of Appeals Members

Kelley Kalinich, Trustee Liaison

Emily Rodman, Interim Community Development Director
Penni Cannova, Executive Secretary

Grant Paplauskas, Communications Coordinator

Atrin Fard, Planner

BBA Recording Secretary

Lori Gloude, Administrative Assistant 11

Brian Baltudis, Facilities Manager

Page 1 of 68



Dear Interested Citizens:

This note provides you with information regarding the process of amending the Village Code. Once public
comments, discussions and considerations have been completed, the Building Board of Appeals makes a
recommendation to the Village Board. The recommendation, along with the meeting minutes, summary
report and all related material, is then scheduled for consideration by the Village Board at one or two
meetings. The recommendation may first be considered by the Village Board at a workshop meeting, which
will be held on a Monday at 7:00 p.m. The recommendation may then be considered at a formal meeting of
the Village Board at 7:00 p.m., for a formal decision. To confirm exact dates for these Village Board meetings,
please call 630-547-5244. The Village Board meets in the Galligan Board Room on the third floor of the Civic
Center, 535 Duane Street.

Individuals with disabilities who plan to attend the hearing and who require certain accommodations in order
to allow them to observe and participate, or who have questions regarding the accessibility of the meeting or
facilities, are requested to contact the Village at least 24 hours before the meeting.

Page 2 of 68



Glen Ellyn Building Board Meeting 6/15/2022 7:00 PM

of Appeals Department: Community Development
535 Duane Street Department Head: Emily Rodman
Glen Ellyn, 1L 60137 Category: Minutes

Prepared By: Steve Witt

AGENDA ITEM (ID DOC ID: 2022-2327
# 2022-2327)

Draft Minutes of Regular Meeting - 05/18/22

Statement of the Issue:
N/A

Analysis:
N/A

Budget Impact:
N/A

Action Requested:
Approve

Attachments:
1. 5-18-22 BBA Meeting Minutes - Draft

Page 3 of 68



DRAFT MINUTES
BUILDING BOARD OF APPEALS MEETING
May 18, 2022

Call to Order and Roll Call

The meeting was called to order at 7:07 p.m. by Building Board of Appeals (BBA) Chairperson Thomas
Bredfeldt.

Roll was called. In addition to Chairperson Tom Bredfeldt, BBA Members Brian Beck, Christopher
Clark, Matthew Rooney, Thomas Tuscher, Robert Stahr and Barrington Pope were present. Also in
attendance were Village Board Trustee Liaison Kelly Kalinich, Building & Zoning Official Steve Witt,
and Recording Secretary Barbara Dutton-Thomas.

Public Comment Non-Agenda Items
There was no public comment pertaining to non-agenda items.

Approval of Minutes

Following a motion by BBA Member Beck, seconded by Member Clark, draft minutes of the April 20,
2022 meeting were approved by roll call vote, with all BBA members voting “Yes,” aside from Member
Stahr, who abstained.

Old Business

Building & Zoning Official Witt distributed a chart (see attached) outlining updates on progress made to
input items gleaned from the Building Community Listening Session hosted last year by the BBA. Staff
has made good progress in developing a survey to elicit customer feedback, he reported, adding that
invitations to participate in it will be provided to session participants and permit applicants. Member
Tuscher asked if the survey responses will be directed to an impartial person to compile. Mr. Witt replied
that, while he doesn’t know if this has been pinned down, he explained that a spreadsheet of information
would be created for review, scoring and measuring performance activities. He said that the responses
will be run through the Communications Department. A motion to accept the report as presented was
made by Member Tuscher; seconded by Member Clark, the motion carried unanimously by roll call vote.

New Business

In introducing the Municipal Code, Official Steve Witt referenced Section Title 3-Hotels, and explained
that the Hotel Ordinance adopted in 2010 requires inspections of the property itself (e.g., common areas)
along with every space in the hotel, particularly every dwelling unit — a time-consuming process. He
related that past annual inspections have yielded very few infractions at the two remaining hotels in the
Village — The Crowne Plaza and The Inn at Water’s Edge — and given complaints from hotel management
that the inspections are intrusive, and that they cause hotel staff extra work, modifying the hotel ordinance
has been requested. Hence, explained Mr. Witt, it makes sense to reduce the number of inspections
performed on an annual basis. The thought, he elaborated, is to inspect 5 percent of the rooms at the
Crowne Plaza and a minimum of two at the other establishment; if numerous violations are found, the
percentage could be increased. A random sampling of different rooms would be inspected the following
year. The common and areas and the site would, he added, continue to be inspected annually.

Page 4 of 68



Title 4-Building Regulations, he noted, is an “administrative exercise” as the changes were limited to the
edition of the codes to be adopted and the deletion of the Life Safety Code.

Relative to Title 4 Chapter 7, the Stormwater and Floodplain Ordinance, Mr. Witt said, modifying the
definition of “substantial improvement” of a property has been suggested. Instead of looking at all of the
improvements made over the life of the building in a floodplain or floodway, he said, the suggestion is to
go back only 10 years. The concept surrounding renovation/upgrade limitations, he explained, is that
groups like FEMA want these structures to go away, as they interfere with water volume/flow. Board
Member Stahr asked if the provision would also apply to repairs (i.e., in the case of flood damage). Mr.
Witt replied that this is correct, and said there is a desire to see the building taken down instead of patched
up. The condensed timeframe, he asserted, actually works to the benefit of the homeowner.

Revisiting the International Fire Code, Mr. Witt said that the words “non-wood burning” have been added
to regulations governing “Stationary Fire features,” and said that “wood burning” would be subject to
regulations governing “Stationary fire pits.”

Jumping to the International Residential Code, Mr. Witt named Item #2, in which he explained that being
added is a requirement that water pressure calculations for fire sprinkler systems be part of the initial
technical submission. Mr. Witt stated that the option to submit the technical submission and the shop
drawings simultaneously, is also available, provided that the package is signed by a professional engineer.

Item #33, said Mr. Witt, has been adjusted to verify that dimensional sawn lumber within the existing
areas of a house is not required to be protected by drywall when the hard costs of a renovation exceeds
$15k. Item #45, he said is changed to allow sandbagging of security fence posts at a construction site in
cases where work is across a driveway entry or in a street or for utility trenching in a public right-of way.
Item #47, he said, clarifies the size of a fire extinguisher to be provided on construction sites.

Items #95-96, he continued, reflect changes embellishing the requirements for radon systems: A radon
system is not required in a “raw space” in basements if the radon level is not equal to or greater than 4.0,
but requires one if the level exceeds 4.0. Chief Clark noted that the test only applies to an existing
basement; Mr. Witt confirmed this, explaining that the proposed language concerns buildouts. Member
Stahr asked if crawl spaces are addressed in municipal requirements for radon systems, to which Mr. Witt
replied that the Village doesn’t have any requirements governing these. Mr. Witt declared that the Village
encourages radon testing.

Substantial discussion ensued over the threshold for requiring fire sprinkler systems be installed in
building additions, in response to a concern previously brought up by local building contractor Pete
Ladesic, who cited inflation in construction materials costs as a reason to raise the current threshold. Mr.
Witt recognized industry reports of hikes in construction costs, and noted that code language was written
to encourage larger additions to be sprinklered. He reviewed scenarios demonstrating the use of an
interactive formula developed to determine when requirements would kick in, though related that the
current approach hasn’t resulted in many projects requiring systems. He stressed that raising the threshold
would result in fewer projects being sprinklered (though emphasized that the Village doesn’t want to
punish an owner of small homes).

Expressing that he doesn’t like requirements for sprinkling additions, Member Rooney asked Member
Clark how many fires have been saved by a sprinkler system. Replying that it’s hard to look at the fires
you don’t have, but noting that sprinklers have been effective, Chief Clark asserted that the purpose of

Page 5 of 68



requiring sprinklers in new construction is to shift the cost of fire protection to the owners of large
buildings, and noted that house size has increased over recent years. Mr. Rooney said he’s not arguing
about new construction, to which the Chief explained that going after small additions isn’t the goal.

Mr. Clark said the objective is to discourage massive additions and remodels to buildings that probably
should have been torn down. He also acknowledged the difficulty in quantifying distinctions in different
types of additions/restorations. Mr. Witt brought up the life safety aspect of sprinklers, recalling that
“flash over” in single-family homes occurs quickly these days because of materials and equipment used in
houses. How an equation might be devised to determine when a sprinkling system is required was
debated, with the Chairperson requesting that Mr. Witt gather more data for deliberating a multiplier and
considering a proposal at the next meeting.

A motion to accept the Village Code Titles 3 and 4 as modified amendments was made by Member
Rooney. The motion was seconded by Member Beck, and passed unanimously by roll call vote.

A motion to approve the modifications to the Residential Code was made by Member Rooney, second by
Member Stahr, the motion carried unanimously by roll call vote.

Trustee Report

Trustee Kalinich declared that the Community Listening Session updates are expected to get follow-up
attention at the Board level. She also related that the Board recently held a workshop to discuss the update
of the Comprehensive Plan, an effort that began one-two boards ago. As such, she explained, assumptions
are being examined, with the process expected to be completed by summer’s end. She said, too, that all of
the BBA-approved code revisions will go before the Village Board for formal adoption, and called the
endeavor to update the codes a “fantastic accomplishment.” She remarked that Mr. Witt, in particular, has
worked diligently on the effort.

Chairperson’s Report

Chairperson Bredfeldt said he would like to be involved in the Code revision review conducted by the
Village Board.

Staff Report

Building & Zoning Official Witt reported that Staff is looking at making minor tweaks to the building
permit fee and deposit schedule. He reported, too, that Apex project management was aiming to get a
TCO [Temporary Certificate of Occupancy] the previous Friday for the second floor, but due to some
outstanding life safety issues granting the occupancy has been postponed. He added that they are trying to
go for Temporary Occupancies for Floors 3-5 come June 1. Mr. Witt said the streetscape project is
continuing — amid two construction projects on Main —at 411 N. and the 413-415 building — that have
commenced. He thanked the BBA for their discussion of the topics presented, and for their dedication to
the community.

Adjournment

Chairperson Bredfeldt adjourned the meeting at 8:44 p.m., following a unanimous roll call vote on a
motion made by Board Member Clark and seconded by Member Beck.

Respectfully submitted,

Barbara Dutton-Thomas

Page 6 of 68



Recording Secretary

Page 7 of 68



313 SUIABI] Aq 10 AIIAIPP puey Aq 134310 “rs 193(oad
31} saAed a1033adsur 3y 3.10J3q 310daa uondadsur oy

Jo Adod & I1a pap1Aoad ST ISUMOIWOY 10 101IBIIU0D )
9SBD YA U] *3)IS UO SI JUO OU UIAJ IO “IIUMOIMOY )
A[uo usym suondddsur urroyrad udyyo s103d3dsur urpping

aY) ‘ssaad0ad qol urejurenr doy o) 310§ ue uI ‘pres jey . "Aeme SMO[q I SOUITJOUIOS
*uoadsur 3y} pafIe] ALy Avtl WI)I ue Aym urejdxa ‘ap1syno Jor st podar uonoadsul oY) J "UOHBULIOTUI

pue suondadsur 31} Jo SJNSII Y) MITAII 0) 10)33dsul 9} SAISI3I JOU SIOP JOOBIIUOD I INq ‘IOUMOIWOY

sy 105 Ayunyaoddo ue sapisoad spy] “uondadsur ‘Bunjoow Ny € e oY} YyIm 1J9] SI JMsa1 uoroadsur oyl sawaWos

JO duwIn Y3 J€ 1S U0 3q 0] ‘Joaady) saneIudsaadaa | depdn ue apraoid pue onsst SIY) SSNOSIP "uonoadsur 3y} JO SWOIINO dYI U0 SUOTILOLIIIoU

PazLIoYINE UE .10 ‘10}DLIIU0D Y} d1mbax Ip

[FeWS 10 S[[eD 103 1, U0p SIOJOBIIUOD JRY) PUlf USYO [

01 199w [[m JudwdooAsg Apunuwwo)

"PIpPE Sem Jey] $$3501d UOTBLIE A 2ATIRNISIUTWIPY oY) Jey)] ajeroaiddy 9

"UOSUIY]Y ‘TRUISL], ‘90B[[BA\ ‘DISmoX[ez)) o0y ‘ZILOIN ‘Uoqne(] ‘siaing ‘1a8uudg o1 sjusundwo)) S
"wred) oY) o Med are jey) 9jdoad poo3 Auew 0S dABH ¥

"YIM JI10Mm 0] 18IS d1 $10302dsur FuIp[img 9snoy-ur oy | €

18213 IR SHI9[D UL MAU Y [, e

Mmm mbﬁmo% 07 uey) paziuesdIo siow yonw st jusunieda(q oy I

Page 8 of 68



~193unod Jruidd

3y je suonsonb Jamsue 0} siseq A[IEp € uo S[qE[IeAR
axe [enJO Fwp[ng pue ‘s103dadsuy a41 pue Suippng
‘TIMIIAIY ue[] ‘SIdUUE[J InO ‘pres jey], 's}dalfoad
Joutw Jo reaoxdde jods-ayj-uo x0j jqeese skempe

SI 0gM J9M31A31 ueld duo Ajuo sey judunteda( oy,

‘Bunoowr oxmy  Je
o1epdn ue opiaoid pue anssI STy} SSNOSIP
0] 199w ]I JuowdO[2AS(J AHunwwo))

*A[21BIpauIuIl paIomsue suorsanb
128 pue sue[d je J0o[ 0} 19ma1Aa1 ueld € M J[qr)
uado ue s1 219Y) 219yMm ‘Aep JTeY 10 ‘Aep ® I9pISU0))

*$19d072A3p J0 s19uMm0 Apadoid

[enpIAIpUI 31JoUaq 0] s1e[[op Iakedxe) aSe[[IA puads o} ajqe
jou a1e am se Jueordde oy 0} s19uISuD 1) JO §1S00 [BIYOE
oy} uo passed skem[e sey aFe[IA oyl ‘s1esuifus Sunmsuos
pasn A[uo o3e[[IA 2} ‘Jey) 210Jog "IeourSus Sunmsuos
o1eand e Aq pajuowajddns 1esurSuy juswdo[aAs(

swy-red v sem o10y) “I0ouISuy [1A1D) SWI-[[N] 3y} 0} I0LIJ

-Sunoow aumnj € Je
ajepdn ue sp1aoid pue ansst Ky} SSNISIP
01 193 1M JusdO[aAd(] AJrunwuuo))

I0M [BNJOR 1) JO 1S00 oY)

01 ajeuorodoldsip are 53509 juelnsuod JuLssurfus
[eUOT}IPPE 9] ")SOO [[BIOAO SOSBAIOUL YOIyMm

yuuad oy 03 pappe s31509 19ouSus Sunnsuod mou
a1e 2197 ‘SUIARI] J2OUISUY [IAL)) IOTUSS 3 YA

"IoynJ puodsal 0} I9pIO UI UISDUOD SIY} Inoqe sajdwexa
oy10ads Posu P[NOM 9\ "MIJADI YOED I0J (S29M 1) sAep
SBuDjIoM ()7 218 SMIIASI J19Y) pue Auno)) afedn(q pajoeuod
apM "Aluno)) a3 uey) IaOMb yonwr axe Yorgm ‘sAep
SSIUISN( ()| 9T8 SMIIASI INQ "SMIIA3I Ue[d umo mo uuojrad
0] STl SMO[[® 11 9SNBO3q }1JoU9q B SI YOIYM AJIUnwuiod
IoArem-[n] & ST UA[[g uslD) Jo a8e[[iA YL s1eak (+51) Auewr
10J 20e[d UI USAQ SBY IS OM ISI[OSYD IAJBMULIOLS Y |, "OPO))
93e[[IA 9} Pue dUBUIPI() INEMULIO}S Ajuno)) afedn( oY)
0} 20ueULIOJuOd 10] sue[d pamaraar skemye sey a3e[[IA o4 L

‘Sumnesw

amng © je ajepdn ue spraoid pue
[e1oua8 ur o1doj o1} ssNOSIP 0} 19YIe50]
198 [ Je1s uewdo[aaa( AlunuIwo))
"UOTIRN[BAD ISYIN] MO[[E 0} IOPIO

Ul papasu 3q P[nom sansst SurasursSus

"9ATIOLSAT A[19A0 FuTaq suonosadsur
PUB SMITASI SULIOUISUD [IIM PAUIIOUO))

o1y199ds U0 UORULIOJUT [BUOHIPPY

"UOTINIIXD I0] WIY 0)

papiemioy aq 1M 199[0ad sty pue ‘ponrels jsnf 10jeUIpIO0))
SUONROIUNWILIO)) Y "9sh Ted juaunteda(T ay) 18y}

[001 Aoams ® pasedard oAey pue SENIUNUIUIOD I9Y10 WOIJ
$]00) AAIms paidyied sary JJe1s uswdo[aas(q Aunuuo))

"Bunoowr omng € Jv
aepdn ue spraoid pue ansst SIY) SSNOSIP
01 193 [[1M JUardo]aAd(] AJunuIuo))

"Yoeqpaa] remn3ar 308 0] ssavoxd
yuirad o) 10J A9yuow ASAINS € 918aId pPnoys

*MI1AJI 10] 10)33dsur

JX3U 3Y) 0) J[E[IeAt pue 1343380} s)10dax uondadsu
da3y] 03 em JuUaTIAAUOI © ST SIY ], "3a0dax wondadsur o)
Jo Adoa e jy0 doap ued 1o03d3dsur ag) Yarga ur ajrs uo Seq
oo[ diz oysefd e urejUIRW S10J9RIJUOD JBY) PUIWTOIAI
M uondadsul Jo U I} J¥ J)IS UO IqE[IEAE

jou ST JU0IMOS UIYM syrodax uogaradsur sy jo sardod
J1U01323]3 10] s3sanbax ss330ad Jouued pue jyeys pagrmyy
seq juaunaedap sy ] "10)ovaIU0d 3Y) 03 papiroad A[uo
Aeard4) axe syr0dad oY) ‘pauniofadd YI0A 3Y) JO MIIAIL
€ uo paseq st J10daa uondadsur a3 adurg uonddsu

JO JUIN) 31} )& IJIS UO 3q 0} J[qB[IBAL )OU ST 10JIRIJU0D
9y} udyMm ALremonaed ‘19132309 YJ0M 0} 10)IBIIUO) PUR
JIdumoduroy ayj) 0) dn st jJ “a00p 3Y) je 310dax uondadsur

Page 9 of 68



Spuey 93e[[LA UL SARD ] ‘SMIJAJL T ‘SAep g7 ul paaoiddy |
"JUSWIWIOD SIY} 9PBUI OYM ISPING Y} POPN[OUT 350Y] JO

2uQ "uonENn[eAd I0J 3unedW ygd 34} 0} Ioud A[ajeIpawuur
syuuad swoy Aqrue; of3urs ¢ pajind a3e[[IA 9y L

"Bunoowr amng e je
s1epdn ue spiaold pue anssy STy} SSNOSIP
0] 139 [[14 Juawdo[2A3(q AlTunurwo))

‘Buog
00} S17e() pue JIwIsd 0] SY9M ¢ PUE SYIIM G J00}
SOWOY MU 0M] 1SB[ A} Jey} paure[dxs Iop[mnq v

‘sgygowt 9[dnoo

© 9B} P[NOJ STY) S[Npayos s Juejnsuos oy uo Supuadaq
"ansqam a3e([1A oY1 uo dew sAnoRISN S, 93R[[IA

3y} uo 124e[ & se )1 3sod [[1m uayy pue dew suy) a3epdn 01
jue}nsuod € UD[SE 3q [[Im S\ "Seale [euorssardop umorry Jo
UO0I}EI0] 91} SUIMOYS JUSWMOOP [BUIIUT U ey 93B[[IA Y

‘Buneow axmny € je
aepdn ue opraoxd pue onsst Syl SSNISIP
01 395w [[im Judwdo[aAd(q AjunuIwo))

-o11qnd a1p) 01 S[qE[TEeAR

J1 9ew pue AIBSSI09U d1e syuswormbal Suussuruo
[EUOLIIPPER 219YyMm ,SeaIe [euoIssa1dap [#00], IO seaie
suo1d-poofj [eurojul, oy3 Jo deuwr e 918315 p[NOYS

*'Sapod

Suruoz 1o urppng 03 paje[ds suonsanb Junyse siourojsna
woJj siseq A[iep & uo s[ied duoydd[d) pue sprewo Auew

0) puodsal oS[ IA\ "SUIIIU0D AN[IQISSIIIT PUE A)dJes
a1y ‘Suruoz 03 3oadsax Yum Apremonred ‘asuerduwod
9P0J [BIUAS 10J SMIIAJI [eUIUT WII0JI3d 0) SN YIIM Joow
0] SIAUWI0IST) PIZLIN0IUI PUE PIIIJJO SABMIE dARY I

*JO[S duur) pPIjeusIsap Y} uryym pajajduod

3q JOU P[NOJ MIIAII Y] UM I0 MIIAII JdJouE
suna[dwiod sem J19MaI1A3I € J[Iyam dwn Jusunyurodde
I19Y) puokaq J1em 0} pey L3y} Uoym papunisip swredsaq
SI2UI0)SN) JWOS *an3anb MarAdx ay) ur pajiesm jey)
S13UI03SND J31J0 Jo peaye s3aa{oad 111y paysnd Aparejun
Yoy “azis 333(o.ad Jo ssappae8ox Surddw yaea jo pud ayy
ju jods-9y)-uo panssi 3q prnoys jnumiad v Jey) 3] £oy) se
suone)I3dxa Jamo)snd Ageuewr 0} qissodunt IWIEIIq I
“[99M € SINO0Y +(} 0] YIIM [IL3 SHOOUIIIJE 0M]) U0 P[AY
SSUredW INOY-] JO SILIIS & WoIf Judm Appdmb weidoad
Y], "weidoad aequirs v paagjo uojsueAy Jjo A1)

oY) JeY) daeMe SUIUI0IIq JI9JE Iy} 31Nud) SIY Surinp
NI BP0 Aq Yaed eQ JO ATe[[IA 293 ul pajudwajduy
SeM s3ungodm Marada uerd uado Jo jdadued ay.

*133UIBUY I3)EMULI0)S Y] put Jusupreda(q

SYI0AA JN[qng 3Y) wro.aj yndur X0 Yo1edsax aambax

udyjo syoaload xadae] 3sow ‘Afrenonippy °sydaload
o[duurs uey) J3YJ0 U0 INOY UL JO ISINOI IY) UI MIIAAL oY)
319[dur0d 03 A1) £3Y]) SE JOMIIAJI € Aq PISSIUI UIIJO dak
SOIUINIIP Ip0) "SUNIIW UAMOP-)IS & FuLIMp ) Jo Isn
183 3y} 3q Jou LeuI YIIYM ‘AIRSSIIN JI “YIIBISII PO
PuE MIIAAL J0J duIN) [euonppe d1mbai s309{oad 1381e]

Page 10 of 68



ueld Suruwiopiad £q asopd 03 L1 aa Jeyj) 10113 UBWINY JO
UI3Iew € ST Iy ], "U0nOINIISU0) e[nTal juy) sadusuIp.Io
pue s3pod §,33eIA 3Y) Y3m duerdwoed J10] payrugns
SJUAWINIOP MIIAJI 0} AZILYD N0 SI JI ‘S.10JLIJU0D

[£90] Ano jo Auvu Jo 13s [[D[S Y} pue s[euorssajoid

U3ISap [0 INO JO JINSUI[ Y} ZruF033ax am ySnoy |,

‘[euotssajoad usisap ay Aq Jjo-usis ay) YIm sSumeap
ay) 03 papuadde aq p[nod yorym jnopusy sjeiedss

B U0 PIJSI| 3 P[NOD SWIJI PIsSTW A[UOTHWIOI SO )
jey) 93a8e o\ "uaddey uazjo Jou SIOP JeY) ‘MIIAII I0]
payruqns 303foad yxou ay) uo dn payard aae swayr passim
A[uowwiod jsour 3} Jey) 32odxa pnom am ySnoyjy

'sguimeap 119Y) Ajrpow o} [euoissajoxd uSisap
3y} InQ dUOAUR MO[[€ JOU S0P J)e}S Y} S JISWI)
SSuIMeIp 3Y) AJIpoul 0) PIPUI}UI JOU ST UOTBULIOJUT

SIYL, 'ponssI 3urdq JmIdd Y3 Jo UORIPUOI € SE JAW Aq 0)
P93 SUOIIPUOD JEYM IJEIPUI 0) SSUIMEIP ) 0} SIYIS

sayae)Ie J1amatrdx ueld oY) ‘sSuimelp ay} o3 pappe
J0 PIJIALI0D 3 0} PIIU JBY) SUWIIJI JIOUTWI AIE JIIY) UIYAL

‘Surnjesw axng € je
ajepdn ue ap1aoid pue anssI Sy} SSNOSIP
07 139w [[1m Juowdo2Aa(] Auntuuio))

(S13p[INg pay1ied

pue sjeuoissajord udsop pasuss| syj JO JUBINSUL
puR SUOLBOYIIID “OsTHIDdXI oY) uo A1 a8e[[IA

oy} 3,ued AYA\ "PaInba ST UONBIUSWNOOP Yonu
007, ‘sue[d 0 pappe aq O} S[1E}3p JOUTI 10J Sunyse
819119] M31431 Surpuas oFe[[IA Y3 Ioyex Jjo uSis
pue 1daooe ued Juesrdde 2y a1oym ooerd s8us € 01
P3PPE 39 P[NOYS SJUSWIWO) prepues jeador oyl [V

*$8320.1d MaI1A3X ueld 3y) Fuofoad A[uo pnom gargm
PISSAIPPE 3¢ 0) PIIU JBY) SWI)I [BUOHIPPE I3S AvwI A1)
‘MIIAII-II B UO PIAJOAUT SAW0IA] IIMIIAI JJvIS 3y} JI
‘A[[euonIppy ‘papIuIqns dIe SSuIMelp PasIAdL Jey) Aep
dUIES 3Y) MIIAII-DI & UL10J13d 03 IpIMpueq YY) dAeY Jou
op A[duiis 94y "M31AdI 3} SULI0JIdd OYM 19)JET OU ‘dun)
punovwin} Aep-g € UIIM pIuLIo)Idd 318 SMIIAII-I1
v s393foad 19yq)0 uo smaraax wxoyrad o) pasn 19339q 3q
P[00 dUIT) [BUODIPPE SIY ], *JX3)UO0D JO INo Way) Sunje)
JNOYJIM SJUIWOI MI1AdL ueld [eursLio 3y) puejsiapun
ued £ay3 jey) os 3193foad Y3 0) sIA[ISWAY) d)vUIIIE

0} IIMITAJL PUOIIS Y} JA0J JWILJ SIYE] JT ‘JJO 1JI[ TOMIIAI
[enmut aq) axaym dn sa1d 13mM31AI TIYjoUe JT “IdL

£q 10 9SNOY-UT IIYIIYA ‘MDA [EYIUI 3Y) pawrtoridd ey
JIMIA 3y} Aq paur10§aad dae SMIIAII-II ‘A[[eaduadn)

‘Sunjesw amyng € je
arepdn ue op1aoxd pue ansst SIy) SSNOSIP
01 139w [1m Judwdo[2A3(] Auntuuio))

"IoUTWEXY SUE[]
Jye1s Aq 9snoy-ut pajpury 9q P[NOYS SMIIAII-IY

‘pourad yead mo Fuump

[[® 919m sa[durexa 3s3Y ] "smoraal juanbasqns 10] sAep ¢

pueR M3IAJI ;] ) I0] SABP (] I8 SAWI) MITAII PILPUEB]S In()
spuey 33e[[IA Ul sAep G ‘Sma1AdlL g ‘sKep ¢ ul paaosddy ‘¢
spuey 98e[[IA UL SABD §] ‘SM3IA2I ¢ ‘sAep 7§ w1 paroxddy
spuey 98e[[IA Ul SABD (7 ‘SMaIAaI ¢ ‘sep (g ut pasoxddy ‘¢
spuey 93[[IA Ul SABP G “SMIIADI T ‘sAep g u1 paaoiddy 7

Page 11 of 68



JUO 0) SMI1AJI Te[d Ino JIu| 0] ALI)S PUE IIIBE AL

01 }9au [[1M Juawdo[aAd(q Arununuo))

3y} 19)ye Sway surppe dols pinoys SISMOIAI Ue[J

£l

*$355320.1d ano droadurn

0) sda)s AUIUIII)IP PUE UMOP IH0.1q WIISAS INO IIGM
JUIULIIPIP 0) ISED YINS YITI MIIAJI 0P Ay “Aep 1Ied
§5900.1d oM SUOISSIWIQNS JTUOI}II[D puk Iiomidded jo
junowe 3y) SULIIPISUOD ISEI IIBI © SI JuY) Jnq ‘J50] UIAq
SeY I © UIYAL SOUIL) U JARY 1Y) JBY) SZIUS00d.1 IA\

‘Bunoow axmy ® Je
orepdn ue opraoid pue onsst SIy} SSNOSIP
0] 199w [[1M Judtdo[oAd(] AjTunwwio))

"150] Surnad
SJUSWINOOD [BUIUANS IAO PISIRI LLIDOUOD SBM 1Y |,

4!

‘PAEO( 3Y) SSOIDE JBY) Op JOoUULd Jnq sdwy uondddsui
ayads 10§ s3sanbaa [erdads Ijepowruodde o) 359q

11913 op sxo3dadsur 3y ], -pajressur Suraq jo ssadoad ayy
ur 3ae Suryseqj pue pAIYS I3JeA pue 3d1 3y) 313y jurod
€ 0] $83.130.1d 0] Y10M Y] MO[[E 0} UOOWIIYE A[IED 10
Surwiow ey 9} w1 pawaoyrad A[esaudd axe suoydsadsur
Sugoox y3noy -Aep yoea paurroyrad suondadsur 3say
ay) ae suondadsur anod-aad ‘10joenyuod ay) Aq asimrayjo
pajsanbau ssaqup) ssaa8oad ui drom 3y) Jo Aefap

IsNEd prnom YoIgm Surnpayasax 3ambaa pue pajajduwod
A[[n} 3q jou pnom suondadsur Aurwi Jey) aq p[nom
JnsaJ A1 Y3 ‘sowreryom) 13343y apiaoad o) d1om

M J °9)IS UO SIIUMOIWOY J0 SI0JILIIUOD [IIM S)[NSaT
MIIAJX pue uodadsur 9y) urro)aad o) £1essad3u se dw
yonu se spuads oym 10323dsuy Surpping ay3 jo uonyuaye
13 343 qim papraoad st uordadsur gaed se suordsdsur
10J soureay aur) 193ysn usmop uid 03 JNIGJIP St I[

"Buneow axmny e Je epdn

ue op1aoid pue onssi SIY) MILAI O}

199w 114 JyeIs Juowdo[dAa( Ajunwuwio))
‘suondadsur 951} 2jePOUIUI0IOE

0] A13 A[[ensn syo309dsul JJe1s a3 oIy

‘suonoadsur
mod-a1d ynm Ajremorred ‘s10310enu0d I0J JNOLJIP
SOWIISWOS 3T8 SMOPULM SUIT) U0T30adSUT INOY-INo,J

Il

yIom wiofrad

0) pouado aae s[rem J3AUIYM Ipo3 03 dn JySnoaq

3q 03 padu [[US [[IM sw)sAs Suiqunid 3unsrxa jey) pajou
9q PINOYS JI “ONSSI STY} IA[0SAT }SIQ UL dIM MOY IUIULIIJIP
0} [d.L VM YI0M [[IA 9 Y3N0Y], ‘S[rem Iy} apisul

PI0Y S3WO0Y JIP[0 INO JO JWIOS Jeym Mmouy 03 jqissoduuy s
)1 33pamow)de pue sasod yuswaambau siyy ey Aynoygp
ay) puejsiapun AN *s)d3{oad Suropouwrar uo MdrAI

ue[d SuLinp papiaoad 3q 03 sureaSerp 1osur Surquunid xoy

judwa.anbal € 0) poje[al 3q 0) JUITIUIOI STY) A AL

‘Bunsow aumny e Je
s1epdn ue 3p1ao1d pue anssI SIY} SSNOSIP
0] 399wl [[1m Justndo[aAa(] Ajunwwo))

"S[Tem 2yl

dn uado Aay; (um Yy Surreap a1 A5Y] 1BYM Moy
1,UOD SI010BIUOD 319YM §199(01d uonelIIqeyal ur
AJN[IqTXa]J 310U 9q PNOYS 219U, "AJUSISLIP pajean
aq pinoys s1oa(o1d Surjopowa1 pue sOWOY MIN

01

*Pa393dsur SI YI0M ) USYM P[IL} Y} Ul SUOIIIILI0D B
03 3urpaau weyy ApPsod ss3f st ‘1aded uo [ps st 193loxd

AY) AIYM smarAax uefd ano y3noay) sanuedardsip asay)
Surdjnuapy “wdyy Joadadjursiux Jo syudwa.nnbaa apod
N0 [[&d Jou op s[euoissajord uSisap sawIWOs ‘Ape[uIg
‘uondadsut [1e] ‘apea) Jo ssappaedax ‘suogdadsur

1% JO 2,07 Aemnxoxddy -moaradr uepd e ur paaar0dsip
3q v SADUIYIP IPOI [[€ JOU JIIQ[E ‘SMIAIT

Page 12 of 68



PINOM JBY] JB9A SIY] SJUSTUJURYUS §S90501d yoInb swos
yuswsdun 01 adoy oM Jnq ‘awry Swos axe) [[1M ssadoxd
SIY], "SPAau INno JOJ 19119q JIom 1St werdoxd 11ty i

998 0] Auedwiod 2IBMIJOS B PIMITAIDIUT ABY AL 'S9SS3001d
1ruad STuo1109]8 JISY) MIIA 0] PIEqUIOT PUE ISIAYUI[E
P3NSIA 9ARy JJeIs 98R[[IA "SPIU Judwedo(] 01 9AINPU0D
j0u s1.9sn Apuarmos om weidord aIemyos ST oY L,

“Burjeowr armny e je
9)epdn ue op1aod pue anssI SIY) SSNOSIP
01 109w [[1m Juawdo[aAd(] Ajunuuo))

"21U01193]2 A]9)21dwIos aq PINOYS S[ENILqNS [[V

91

aInynj

9y} ut suonen)is xe[iuis ydeoidde 0) moy puejsiapun 0]
s1030adsur ay} J0J pue SIPOI Y} U0 ISe( ISPI[MOWY LIdY)
3SEBIIOUI 0] JJB)S IY) JSBUOLIE PIMIIAII SI ISED YINS ydey
“10s1A13dns 1121 Jo uorurdo v ydas Lay) ‘yuerdwod
apod jou sI jey) Surgjowos daoidde o) payse aie

A9Y} 319G M UOHBN)IS B [IIM PIJUOIJUOD UIYM ‘IIAIMOT]
‘PRY oY) ur A[1emonaed ‘Umo I19Y) U0 SUOISIIAP IeW 0)
waY) A3LIN0dUd M pue ‘AJLioyIne siy) sey ApeaIfe jJers

"Surjeowr aImng € Je
a1epdn ue opraoid pue ansslt Sy} SSNOSIP
01 190 [[1M Juswdojaas Aunwwo))

"SONSST JOUIW UO SUOISIOIP
oYeul 0] ABMI3[ 2JOW SPadu Jyels Suipping sy

SI

-az1s 333[oad

PUE Y.10M Jo 3d0ds o paseq SIINAIIS 353Y) apiaoad o)
1500 5,33E[[IA Y} JO MITAII JAISUI)XI ue 13jJe pado[arap
sem Ipayds Jsoda( pue 39, JULIdJ JUILIND Y] “purua
ur jey) YUAA ‘suondddsur pue Sunyruaad ‘marsax uerd oy
$321A19s 3urpraoad ano Jo 3503 3Y) U0 paseq 3q P[noOYs §33j
NI "10J3.13Y) PIBILYD 319M SIJJ Jeym pue sprunrad
pa.nbal SUId)I NI0M JeYM U0 SIPIUNWII0D TUIIM)IQ
AJU3)SISUOD OU SBM 3.19Y] JEY) PIJOU AL "PIAIAINS

31M SAIUNUWIIO) Suipunolins Aq pagieyd s33) ‘6107 Ul

‘Bunoow sumny 1B
a1epdn ue opiaoid pue ansst Iyl SSNOSIP
01 3199w 1M Juddo[dA3( AjTunwwio))

"SUMO)
19y30 Ul uey) 12y31y a1e §1509 Jruwrad s uk[[g U

14!

*319 ‘5199Y$ €JEP JaIn)dejnuenl ‘syiodas ‘sSuUImMEIp
paambai [fe Surpnpur adeyded aAsusysrduiod e Jruqgns
0) ST UonJENJIS SIY) PIoAE 0) AeM Js3q Y], "papiroxd

aq 0) uonjewIoyul 10 suonsanb feuonIppe JueLIEM
SHUdUIWIO0I MIIAIL ue[d ano 03 sasuodsai ay) UdPQ

*J1))E PAUGHIPUOIUN IY) W0.1] )1 )etedas 0] uonemsul
JONp pue ‘[BAOWAI 9JBSUIPUOD Y} 10] Surquunid ‘dnje
) ul aan)xy JYSI| & SUIPPE SE YINS SWI)I I0] SJUIUWIIOD
MI1A31 [euoippe pojduroad s1yJ, “matada uepd jegrug ay)
13)J& d1JJE 31} 0] JUSWISE( I} WOIJ PIAOUI SEAL dIBUIN]
aY) 313y 393l0ad & pasjoaur agou Im jdurexs suQ

*S[TE] UI)J0 JAOQE S LIIJI IIPUN PISSNISIP
§s320ad maraax uerd uado Yy Aym uoseas ay) Apoexd
SI pue dwy saye) siy ), ‘333foad & 03 syudwIwod ppe
A[[enunuod 03 YIPMPUER( ) IABY JOU OP IM SE pUNoI

‘duneswr a1mng € je
o1epdn ue spiaoId pue ansst STy} SSNOSIP

*ma1A31 ued renur

Page 13 of 68



01 A1y AJ1e[ngo1 oYM SISP[INQ 7 9ABY A[UO 9A| “PI[NP3IYDS

st uorjoadsur [euy oy} 210Joq sAep ¢ ur sKoans Surpeid [euy
9AEBY 0] PI3U SISP[ING Jey) 21e]S S0P 199YSIom S, 9Fe[[IA
9], 'PAYSI[qEISI ST 19A00punoId 2ouo pasoidde st Surpeid
Teurq -suonoadsm Surpeid reury worad 01 Ai[iqe mo
sy “1ajum ur AJ[eroadsa “1oyieap smaraax Suipeis [euy
qum dn daay 03 9[qe u2aq aAry aM ‘uuiy Furnmsuod e Juisn
aIB aM JBY} MOU ‘OSTY SABp SSauIsnq ()] UIYIIm Sma1aar ue(d
[1e 9191dwod so0p 193urSus Sunnsuod Y], "JJeIs pojIw oy}
qIim A1epuodas a1om syruad Surpring 1no 9so[o 0] SMa1ASI
Surpeid [eur ‘Suraow s3oaloxd doay 01 smaraar jruuad
uuog1ad 03 sem Kquioud oy ‘Iye)s uo 19ouISus SUO YA

‘Guneswr axmny € Je
o1epdn ue spraoid pue ansst SIY} SSNOSIP
01 J0ou [[1m Juawdo[oAd(q ANunuwuo)

‘SAED () UI SMOTASI ISJEMULIOLS
uuopied 03 Juelmsuoo € 2y pnoys aSej[iA oYL

0c

*19JUN0d

yudd 3y je Jjo paddoxp aie £dY) UIYM J0OU ‘[JL

[ora SSULMEBIP dY) 3IU0 SUISI( dweLdwr) Aep-0T Y.
'siseq APwn € ul [41, Suryoeas jou ddexoed eynuqns
9Y) Ul PIA)[NSII Jey) SINSSI [BUIJUI JO ISNBIIQ SEAM Jey)
Aqrensn nq ‘s{ep @ 93 3sed uUnI SMI1AAI [J L JBY) Iudk

® 5w 0M] 10 3uo Afuo sdegaad dae 313y ], *0} paiaype
SI SAep SSOUISN( (] JO SWRIFITIL) MIIAII [BLIIUI )

3INSUI 0] SAUII) PUNOJIBUING MITAdI ued [J ] I0)JIUOW I AN

‘Sunsowr sy v Je
9)epdn ue op1aoxd pue onsst SIY) SSNOSIP
01 395w [[im Juswudojaas(g Ajunurwo))

"1 0} OIS PuE SMIIAdI ue[d
I0] sA®p (] JO UOIEJIWI] SWI} B 9ARY P[ROYS [,

61

‘uon)dadsur ) jo dueApE

Ul [[9A S3WIT) [PALLIE }J€X3 191paid 0] paey SI J1 ‘910Ja.191])
‘ago1dmrod 03 s130 uey) II3u0] e} 1M suordIdsur
awos ‘onbrun st wonpdadsur goed sdurg “uondddsur
snoradad 213 3uraed] axe A3y} udgm [Ied A[uo £3y)

SSI[UN JJR.INIIE I JOU ABUI IDTJOU IIULAPE 3} JEY) pajou
2 pPINoyYSs 1 Inq “931S UO JALLIE APYI] [[IM A1) UdIYm
MOWY $.10398.1JU0I JI 0} PBIYE [[€D [dL dABY [[TM AL

‘Bunosur samyny
® 1 9jepdn ue apraoid pue 1J 1 YIM STy}
SSNOSIP (1M Justudo[aasg Ajrumuuro))

"SALLIE [[IM 10302dsur oy}
USQM SWIT) ® SAIS J,UOM/}, UBD $10303dsul [J ] swIog

81

*JJe)S ISNOY-Ul 1IN0 PUB WIAY) UIIMII( SIIUI)SISUOIUT
Aue dzrmmurm 0} )dwaye e ui sainpadord pue sadiod
Ino puejsIdpun Wy} dAey 0} sio03dxadsur Kyred-paryg)
JINO0 YJIM JI0M 0P A\ ") ) Aq paambai se yiom
surquunid yo woposadsur maoyrad 03 Jye)s uo saqunyd
POSUIII] € JARY JOU SIOP ISL[IA Y] dUIs suondddsuy
duios wr10L1dd sAempe A1 (M ‘AdudaBe 1ag)jo

9WIOS 10 ‘I ] *S10333dsuI 3y} J0j SuruILI} pUE JJ0 dWN)
[euosiad ‘sassaudIs 10J 19400 0) smoydddsur mriojrad
0) £>uade A)red-pary) v AZI[N 0} PIIU IM SE I[QISEIJ J0u
Aduuts st 31 “393f01d waAIS & uo suondadsur e wroyrad
10)09dsur dures 3y} IARY 0] 3S9q 3q p[noMm 1 ySnoy,

"ONSST ST} SSNOSIP JAYUIN] 0} J99UT

[T Juswrdo[aAa( AJTUNUIWIo)) ‘I9AIMOL]
"A[uo suo110odsul [BIJUSPISAI 0} PAJIWI]
2 Jou pue Suor}dadsul [BIOISUNUOD

Op 03 ysim s1030adsur asnoy-uj

‘sgonoadsur

[BI0IOWIWOD [[B Op [J ] PU® Suor}oadsul [eLuapISal
[1e op s1030adsur asnoy-ur 19521d pnop “s1030adsur
Id L 2sn ueyf) s10302dsur Jye)s ppe ISRl p[no
*$10199dSUI JJe1S S PAJUSLIO JOWIOISND SB J0U dIe pue
uonesrdde apoo uT Ju2)ISISUOS jJou o1e s10303dsul [T,

"oulr) AI9A3 10103dSUl JUSIOLIIP B 9q UED J] *S10309dsur

Id.1 Yam sanmoygip Suraey di1e s10j0e1U0))

L1

SJUB)[NSUO))/[PUUOSIIg

'S[ERIUqNS JMU01}I3[ SZIPIEPUE)S |

Page 14 of 68



ydap ‘azis Aj11aa 0) pajdadsur 3q 03 pasu suonEpUNo} [V |

0] 199 [[IM JUaWdO[9A(T AJTunuruo)) _

03 J011d A1285200U [oUaT) o) JO UoNoadsul ST AYM |

*'sapo))

[euonewIdNU] Y} Jo §333dse [[& 19400 Yarqm (ISI[ payIe)e
995) SUONEIYNIID §S IARY SIIMIAM ued [LL om)

aY) ‘A[9ADIS[I0)) "SIJE)IS PIJIU() Y} U S[BUOCISSIJOIJ PO
I3)SEIA] 00L PUNoOIe A[UO 3.1 3I3Y) JEY) pajou d3q Pmoys J|
‘[1PUno)) 3po)) [EUONBUIINU] ) Aq PIPIOJJe UCHEIYILIID
JO [9A9] 359431y 3y} SI JBI], ‘[IDUN0)) IPO)) [EUONBULINU]
3y} Aq PIYI1IdI SE S[EUOISSIJOIJ IPO)) I)SBA

a1e )oq osfe £33 Inq ‘sadquinid pasuIdI| SToUT([[ Yoro
A3y} aae A[uo JoN ‘S1amarAda ued urew om) seq [d1

‘Bunesw armng © je
91epdn ue opraoxd pue ansst SIY) SSNISIP
0] 103w [[1m Juswdo[aAd( AHuUnwwo))

"sgurmerp
[RIMO91IYDIR MITAI 03 Idquinjd pasusor] e sosn 141,

L4

‘suondadsur 10y s3sanbag 10] sauIl punoie winj JI0ys
ureyurewr d{oy o) sIseq papaau se Ue uo uf Jysnoiq si

Id1L “sepnp xe[n3aJ 1Y) 0) Yoeq dae s10)dadsuy Suippng
ay) pue Jojdadsuy dueuduiey A113doxg mMau € paarg
dARY M ‘udy) duIS ‘sjurejduwod dueuurew Aradoad
Surpuey a1 Suysisse 1AM s10)3adsuf Surpymy o) pue
“uedea sem uonisod 10339dsuy dueudjuiey A313dorg
3] UIYM WD) © J& PIsSAIAXI SeA JUIWTOD STY L

‘Sunsowr sy e je
ajepdn ue op1aoid pue anssI SIY) SSNOSIP
0} 190 [[1M JuRwdo[2As(g Aruntuwio))

"oty yoeq paysnd Sumyed sdaay suonoadsur
uoroNISuod Jo AJI[Iqe[ieAr S ], ‘PLO{Iom
Jo1padsut SuIpTIng MI1A1 0 Spaau oFe[[IA oYL

114

"13uLdS 1030311 10 NIM [BISIJJO SUIUOZ pue Surp[ing

Jo uonuaye oy 03 way) Suirq osead ‘sansst og1oads

aIe 2193 J] "uSISap JO JONUISUT JOU S0P WILd) M) "9p0)d)
a8e[IA o3 ur Jou a1e Jey) sSuryy 1oy Sunyse 10U St JJRIS
"suonsagsns 130 [Tim a8e[[IA oy ‘soseo asoyl up "10sfoxd
UuonONISUOD AGIedu © AqQ PA1RqI90EXa Jou a1 swapqoxd oy}
aIms 9ewW 0] JueM oM pue ‘sonsst afeuteIp jnoqe pame[duwod
aaey 1oumo Apedoid Jouid © 1o sioqudiou ‘sarjradord owos
10, "YIOM J0U Op SUSISSP SWOS JBy) MOUWY oM ‘aousuadxo
mo uo paseq -SurAjos wa[qoId Ur SISUWIOISNI ISISSE 0}
sidwane a8eq(iA oy "onbrun st Anadoid yoes pue a3eurerp
0] pajerar a3eqIA oy ur saSuajreyo enbrun a1e 219y |,

‘Suneswr a1y © 18
a1epdn ue sp1a01d pue ansst S} SSNOSIP
01 190w [[im Juswdo[aasg Ajrunuwwio))

"s3ury) uS1sop 0) MOY S10}0BIIUOD
Suryie; Aq AJLoyINe 19y} YOROLIIAO J9ouISuy
I9)EMULIOIS PUR [RIOJ(O Suiuoyz pue Suipping Iy,

C

*sosuodsau A[duIn aJ1ow Ipiaoad 0y

s[[ed suoyd pue s[remd Y3noay) LI 0} SIseq A[Iep v uo
$INOY SUD]IOM [EULIOU J.10Jdq W) IPISE J3s SeY I °S[[Ld
suoyd pue spremwd o) sasuodsax Apurry jo adue)rodury

9y} SaZIug023.1 [ePYJO Suruoz pue Surpping sy I,

‘Buneow a1yny e 38
9epdn ue op1aoid pue onsst SIY) SSNOSIP
0] 199U [[im JUSTdO[2A3(] AJIUNUIUIO))

"S[[0 pue S[IRWIS W21
01 owry Suoj e saxe) [ero1f3Q Sutuoz pue Surpyg

14

"UOT)RULIOJUT

s1owr papiaoid a1e om J1 sonsst oy1oads 0] puodsas

UBd 9A\ 'SPunjai pue jno 9sofo puuad ay) SAB[P yoIym
‘SIY} INOQE SISP[ING (] JO INO G PUIMIDI 9| WIS} SPUILLDI
oBe[IA 97} [HUN JIeM SISYI0 8y, Juswannbal jey) 195w

Page 15 of 68



JSRURUI UB) 3M ‘[IBUWId BIA SJI9)]3] SUIPUIS Ag “MIIAII INO
1M 91 34e IM UdY) pue dn Moo} & uo Suniesm e om
39310} Aews am ‘AppdInb sn 03 yaeq 333 you sd0p sucdwos
JI " 19119[ MI1A3 3 daedaad oy pud 1no uo 13dInb s1 1

“Su0[ ST SAUIIIGIP JO ISI[ Y)Y JI Jng "PISSNISIP 3q 03 pasu

Jey) swdyI d[duurs 1. 3I3Y) TWIYM A[JIIIIP SI0)ILIIUOD

‘Sunsswr axmng € je
ajepdn ue spraoid pue anssy SIY} SSNOSIP

‘uerd oy o1 sojou [eaoidde swos Suippe J9matAdI
ueld a3 pue [[eo suoyd € Aq paA[Osal 2q P[Nod
SaNssT AuBW 0§ "INO 19139] B FUIpUSS A[JeIpawtul
uey) Joyjel suonsanb are a19y) J1 19p[mq

pue s[euoissajord uSisap 1oBIU0D 0P SISMIIAJL UL 01 193W M JUsTdo[aAd( Aunuwo)) | oy [reo pue suoyd sy dn 3o1d pInoys sIoma1Ad1 ue[J 0€
‘uefd a1y
aredaid o3 91qe 2q [ [euoissajord pasuaol] Auy “10ouISud
[emionns e Aq paurIojrad 2q 03 pasu JOU [[Im MITADI
3y} ‘OS[Y "Pajen[eAd aq [[e} SAYOUI {4 ULY) 19)ea1d s[[em
AJuo 1ey) SUTPUSWIUIO2I ST JJBlS “YOIeasal Jey) Uo pasey ‘Sunoow sImnj € Je "SUMO] [[e ut pannbai 10U ST SH[], (AIeSSa03U
"SJUSWIAIINDOX JB[IUIIS 9ARY OP PIAAINS oM 950Y) JO ISO]A |  a1epdn ue apraoxd pue anssi iy} SSNOSIP Aqrea1 11 s] Y31y 199J-921y) I9A0 S[[em Surureias
"SJUAWAIMbAI IT19Y] U0 SIITUNUWILIOD Y0 PIKIAINS JJRIS 011991 [[1M Juado2Ad( Ajrunwiio)) | 10§ A1essaoou Sumerp parsourSud ‘padwiess e st Ayp 62
"pastwioiduiod jou st Aj1oedes 19mas ULIo)S oY) "Buneow a1ny € e
a1ns 9yew 0} pajenyeas si10aloxd yoey ‘siseq oseo-£q-osed | ajepdn ue spraoid pue snsst sIy) SSnOSIp
B U0 MOU WIDISAS JOMIS UII0)s 93e[[IA 9yl O] SUOLIUUOD 01 199U [[1M JuaWdo[9A3(] AJUNWuIo))
MO[[E SI0p SYIOM O1[qng ‘uoyeyI Ayioedes siyy | auy wols ayy ut Ajoedes ySnous st siyy
0} anp a8e[[IA 2Y} Ul pue[ 9y} [[B UTeIp jouurd A3y ] '$19918 2I9UM JOMOS ULIO)S A1} 0] SUOIOAUUOD
93e[TIA 29U} ATUO UTRIP 0} POUTISOP 918 SIOMIS IJEMULIOIS s10w FUIMO[[R U32q SBY SYIOM OT[qnd | ¢IMas WLI0JS oY} OJUT PaT} 9q sjnodsumop 3,ued Ay 8T
*AeM-JO-)Y3LI o[ qnd Y] WO} MIIA WOI] PIPIYS
axe A3y se 3uo] se uonedIO] Jwes ay) ur padejdai aq urd
sjun [edueyadw unsixy ‘s1dumo Lyradoad yuadselpe "Suneaw
£q yudwAolud 3omb yo 1y311 3y 19330ad d[ay 03 s3AIds | 2xmyny © Je WY Iy} uo repdn ue spiaoid
$0qaze3 pue se[05.13d 10J orvq)as 1938a1s Iy ‘soqazed PUE SJTUN )/ I0J SOBqI3S MIIAAI "mou 3armb 0s a1e sjIun Oy
pue se[odiad yjIm se asiou djewl pue 3)e3313u0d aydoad 0] JUsWpuUsWE 3pod e Jo Aiqissod oy mau Y] (sejodied pue sjun Dy 1,ued Aym ‘our|
3IOYM SBIIR AJADIE JOU I S3Feavs pue Spays payaeja( |  aren[eAd [[im juswdofaasq Aunwwo) | Auadoid oyl wox 309 € 9q ued sagered payoeap J| LT
*SJUdWAIINDA 3U001 JO IOUMOIWOY PUE 10)ILIIUOD Y}
y1oq woyut djay o) ynopuey e Surdo[aaap s1 jusumaeda(
YL “I2UMOIWOY 3Y) JO JIJAUIq Y} 0} pourroyrad
u33q seq qol Lyijenb e arnsud o) sdjay uondadsur
paanbaa a1 axyewr 03 3)1s uo a10333dsur 3y} Suiaey
*pa33[dmod ud3Jo ST I0M Y] ‘pIPadu Iq 0) PIUTULIIIIP
31e SUOIIILI0D udYM ‘A(djeunirojun jnq sgdeadojoyd
JnS 0} SI0JILIIUOI PIMO[[E JABY AL “IIUMOIUIOY
9y} 199304d Apjewmn pue jonpoad 3y3 jo uoneelsul
Jadoad aq) £f1194 0) A1es$339U J1E suondddsuy (soroyd
*PUIIXI 0] SPIAU PIIIYS I3JeM pUE 31 3Y] Jooi e dn ‘Bunssw sy v je | JIWUGNS PUE 9] JOJOBIUOD 3 3, UBD Aym ‘AIessoodu
Aej Moy 10y yudwraainbaa oy3 pue)sispun jou op a3e[A | 9jepdn ue apraoid pur anssI SIY) SSNOSIP ST J] (Juswannbal STy} pus am ue)) (AIessaosu
) UM SunjIoMm SI030EIIU0D FULJ00I Y] JO AUBIA 0} 195 [1M Juawdo[aAd(] Arunwuio)) uoroadsur plorys Isjem pue 301 ue st AYA\ 97

‘PapPaadXd
jou st L31deded urieaq [1os uSIsap Y} JIMSuUI 03 PI[[Aq
Aj1odoad axe swopnoq 3y yeyyy ‘s1aid Jo ased oY) ur pue

‘Sunsow aimng e 18
a1epdn ue opraoxd pue onssT STy} SSNOSIP

{Suruely

Page 16 of 68



13)32q dWIEIFAUT) MIIAII A1) |

Page 17 of 68



(820Z/€0/¢0 $911dx0) 10152dsUT [¥I1UEYIDN [EIIAWWOT)
(8207 /€0/ €0 sa31dxa) 1010adsuy Surpmg repmuIw@on)
(820z/¢0)/¢n)$231dx0) sounexy suvy fup|mg

(8T0z/£0/ €0 samdxa) spunuex;{sur[q /romadsug A31auy [Enuapisay
(8207 / <0/ €0 sa11dxa) 10300dsu jedruEyaa]y [ERUIPISIY
(8207/£0/¢0 sandxa) 10adadsuy Buiquingg [enuspisay
(R20Z7/£0/€0 $a31dx0) 30190ds50T [£2(1122[3{ [EIAIDUILON)
(8202/£0/€0 $731dX0) IDUIUEXT] SUB[| GONTUIGLUOT)
8z0z/¢0/¢0 soudxa) mururex;y suel] /301adsu] Aqissnody
(820T/€0/ €0 sondxo) [roy3O) Fup[mg paynIay

(8202 / 0/ 50 soadxn) 1aurwmys| sur]q Suiquim[g
(8202/50/€0 spadxa) 10135dsuy Fuiquin(q [eRUIWOND
(8z0z/¢0 /€ spmdxa) soradsu] [22m123); [BNUSPISIY
(8202/£0/¢0 sondxo) ro190dsu] Burpimg [Frusprsay
(820z/£0/§0 s9atdx2) 1putUIEX Y SUL [EIIUTYIIN

820z /¢0/¢0 sondxa) z0190dsup Burquuniy

(szoT/¢0/£0 sp3dxa) soroadsul [earmoary

(8202/¢0/¢0 sp31dxa) 1o1dadsuy Hugpring

(8zuz/c0/c0) sandxo) 10130dsu] [earuuiao]y

(820 /£0/€0 saudxa) 3senadg apo) Supmg

(Rz0¢/€0/¢0 sandxn) asqeraadg apop) Surqumiy

(820T/€0/ €0 sondxa) 3steadg 2poD) [Earuyasy
(820T/¢0/¢0 sandxa) 1symaadg apoy) peamdary

(820Z/€0/€0 saardxa) 1o193dsut wontuiquuar) [Tuuaplsay
820z /€0/€0 soxdxs) 10130dsuy wonrurquion)

(8202 /<0/€0samdxa) s010adsuy uonTUIqWOY) [BPINUWOT)
(820z/€0/50 so1dxs) 10190dsuy AFinug EoIMWWON

(8202 /€0/¢0 spndxa) 1030adsug Busnoy pue ssucumurely A1adory
(920T/<0/¢0 so31dxd) [Luorssajorg ApOD) INSEN

(820T/€0/<0 s21dxa) Jaurumexy] suL[] [v21I193]F

reurst], ydasof

GT0T/#1/L0 3311dxa) T0192dsUT UOPLUIqUWOT) [ERUAPISIY
2oz /¥1/L0 soadxa) so10adsur Suiquingyg enuapisey
(vzoz/¥1/:0

sondxa) sounuexyysurl /1013adsu AfI0us] Enuspisay
(bTOT/¥1 /L0 s201dxa) JauTtex sup[] [ED1UTYIA]Y
(#20z/$1/40 s931dx3) 30103dsu] Suppimg renuaprsay
20z /%1 /L0 spndsa) soadsur Suppng [empsswuwo:)
2oz /+1/ L0 s9mdxa) 3aunuryy sueld /ro1adsu] Spqissaooy
&T0T/¥1/ L0 spndso) puURUERy SuT] [E9MII97g
#20T/+1/ L0 s2mdxa) [LUOISSIJOI] SPOT) INSTIY
(#T0T/P1/L0 sendxa) sounuexy suvlq Supng
(#20T/¥1/20 sandxa) epuz Supng paunial
HT0T/¥1/ L0 $21dxa) 1010adsu] [eo1uvyd3[y [BIAW0”)
(bcoc/#1/L0823dxa) sauiuexy sueld Suiqumig
&20T/¥1/ L0 spardxa) mpunuexy suel] UoneuIquion)
T0Z/¥1/L0 sp71dxa) 50100dsu] [esmdary Euuapisay
#20T/+1 /L0 s20d¥a) 10159dSUT [EDMOS[E [FDISWWOT)
20z /¥1/.0 sandys) 1010adsuy Suppng

Fe0g /¥ 1/ L0 sandxo) so130dsuy [esrusyaap

#20T /¥ 1/ L0 sandxa) xo1vadsuy [ed1noarg

(b20T /%1 /L0 soxdxa) s01vadsu] Swiqumnig

(F20T/¥1/L0 sandxa) 1sieadg spo)) Supimg
(FT0T/¥1/ 20 saudxa) asyepadg apo?) Suiquinig
(reoz/v1/ L sendxa) asipeaadg 2po)) rearusyangy
(FrTog/+1/ L0 soadxa) asyepadg opor) [earaarg
(20T/+1/L0 sPndxe) soadsu] vontuiquor)
te0z/F1/ L0 sondxe) sormadsu] voneuIquor) [EIWWOT)
G20 /#1/ L0 sandxa) roadsul Suiquinyg [cosswwo)
G20 /41 /L0 s24idxa) s0139dsu] [@aueyaIN (eRUIPEIY

TEUISL] 94918

SUONEDYIIDY) DD I9MIIAY Ue[J ILL

Page 18 of 68



Glen Ellyn Building Board Meeting 6/15/2022 7:00 PM

of Appeals Department: Community Development
535 Duane Street Department Head: Emily Rodman
Glen Ellyn, 1L 60137 Category: Discussion Item

Prepared By: Steve Witt

AGENDA ITEM (ID DOC ID: 2022-2326
# 2022-2326)

Review of codes regulating construction for potential adoption

Statement of the Issue:

See Staff Report

Analysis:

See Staff Report

Budget Impact:

N/A

Action Requested:

Approve

Attachments:

1. Staff Report - Building Codes Upgrade Meeting 8 - 061522

2. Attachment - A - Crains Chicago Business Chicago Construction Costs Third Highest in
Country

3. Attachment - B - ICC Building Valuation Data - August 2021

4. Attachment - C - Turner & Townsend International Construction Market Survey 2019

5. Attachment - D - NAHB Cost of Constructing a Home

6. Attachment - E - Calculation of Project Hard Cost

7. Attachment - I - Fire Sprinkler Modification Factor Analysis - 060722

8. IFC-2 - Proposed Revisions to Amendments Previously Approved by the BBA (Redlined)

9. IFC-3 - Proposed Revisions to Amendments Previously Approved by the BBA (Clean)

Page 19 of 68



MEMORANDUM

TO: Chairman Bredfeldt and Members of the Building Board of Appeals
Kelley Kalinich, Trustee Liaison

FROM: Steve Witt, Building & Zoning Official

CC:

DATE: June 10, 2022

RE: Building Codes Upgrade
BBA Meeting 06/15/22

At the Building Board of Appeals meeting held on May 18, 2022, the commission requested staff to
present additional information related to the Modification Factor proposed for use in determining when
a fire sprinkler system would be required when construction work is performed on an existing single-
family residential dwelling. The following information is provided in response to that request.

Background:

Currently, the requirement for providing a fire sprinkler system in an existing single-family dwelling is
based on a review of the extent of alteration and/or remodeling work and/or the size of an addition.
Current amendments to the Village’s Residential Code (“IRC”) require fire sprinklers to be installed as
follows:

a. In the addition when the gross floor area of the addition exceeds 2,500 square feet, or throughout
the addition and the existing building if the combined gross floor area of the addition and the
existing building exceeds 5,000 square feet (IRC 4603.4.3), or

b. Throughout the existing building and any addition if the structurally altered existing exterior wall and
roof gross square foot area exceeds 75% of the total existing exterior wall and roof gross square foot
area (IRC 4603.4.4), or

c. Throughout the remodeled interior area of the existing building if the hard cost of all remodeling
work exceeds $300,000 (IRC 4603.4.5).

Opver the past five years, these code provisions have resulted in few cases where the need for fire
sprinklers in an addition or through the existing house was triggered.

Issue:

Though the first two code requirements noted above are easy to assess from floor and roof plans, and
building elevations which are submitted with a permit application, both project and hard costs' are not.
The hard cost is often misunderstood by applicants and therefore, mis-reported on the permit
application. Additionally, we have no way to break out costs associated with construction of an addition
and the cost of interior remodeling when permit applications include both scopes of work. Construction
valuation is often under-reported by permit applicants or adjusted when applicants understand there is a
threshold dollar amount over which fire sprinklers are required. This makes the third code requirement

X:\Plandev\Witt\2018 Code Upgrade\Meeting 8\Final\Staff Repott - Building Codes Upgrade Meeting 8 - 061522.docx
Page 1 of 4

Page 20 of 68



difficult at best to enforce. To circumvent this issue, the fire sprinkler threshold could be determined by
using published national average construction costs. The use of national average costs would be
conservative as construction costs within the Chicagoland area are higher than the national average".

The three code requirements listed above were written to increase the level of fire safety within the
Village; however, they have led to very few additions being required to have fire sprinklers installed in
previous years. In 2021 and 2022, twenty-nine additions were permitted for construction. Only three of
those cases resulted in the requirement for installation of fire sprinklers™.

Methodology:
In order to increase the fire safety of our existing residential building stock through the addition of fire

sprinkler systems, I previously recommended the implementation of a Building and Structures
Modification Factor (See proposed amendment IRC 1103.5.9, which is item number 63 in Attachment
IFC-3). Some projects have extensive addition, alteration and remodeling work, but usually none of the
three thresholds are exceeded. The intent of the Modification Factor is to take a holistic approach by
considering the overall effect that additions, alterations and remodeling has on the existing building, not
just individual portions of the total project.

The proposed formula is simple to use. The square footage values required to be input are already
provided by permit applicants in order for the project to be reviewed for zoning compliance. Other than
multiplying three numbers together, it requires no additional time for staff during the permitting process.
The project and hard costs, as well as the Modification Factor, would be calculated as described below:

1. Caleulate construction cost: 'The International Code Council™ (“ICC”) publishes updated national
average building valuation data every six months’. The square foot construction cost is published
for each Use Group and construction type. The Village currently uses this data to establish the
permit fees for large commercial construction projects. For the R-3 Residential, one- and two-
family Use Group of construction type VA, which most single-family dwellings are, the reported
square foot construction cost as of August 2021 was $157.66". To verify the validity of the ICC
construction cost data, Turner & Townsend’s International Construction Market Survey, 2019
was reviewed. That survey indicated the construction cost in the Chicago market to be $161.00,
which is reasonably close, but higher than, the ICC value of $157.66. The estimated construction
cost of the addition is calculated by multiplying the altered (new) floor area in Column F of
Attachment F times $157.66 and is recorded in Column 1.

2. Calenlate the construction hard cost: 'The National Association of Home Builders (“NAHB”)
published a study on the cost of constructing a single-family home™. As part of that study, the
NAHB presented a spreadsheet indicating the cost for the construction of a 2,594 square foot
new single-family home. Costs that were not generally attributable to the construction of an
addition, such as land cost, marketing cost, sales commissions, etc. were deleted from the overall
construction cost of $485,128™. The resulting construction cost was reduced to $296,652.
Further, costs not associated with hard cost, such as interior finishes, cabinetry, countertops, etc.
were then deleted to determine the non-hard costs of the project to be $52,544, or 15% of the
total project cost. Therefore, applying a factor of 0.85 to the overall construction cost would
determine the project hard cost. The estimated construction hard cost of the additions was
recorded in Column J of Attachment F.

3. Calenlate contribution of additions, alterations and remodeling: In Columns K, L. and M of Attachment F,
the following ratios were calculated:

X:\Plandev\Witt\2018 Code Upgrade\Meeting 8\Final\Staff Repott - Building Codes Upgrade Meeting 8 - 061522.docx
Page 2 of 4

Page 21 of 68



a. Column K: ratio of altered floor area to existing floor area
b. Column L: ratio of altered wall plus roof surface areas to existing wall plus roof surface
areas
c. Column M: ratio of hard cost to threshold value of $300,000
4. Calenlate the Modification Factor: The three ratios calculated above are added together and reported

in Column N of Attachment F. If the Modification Factor limit is set at 2.0 as previously
presented to the BBA, then 6 of the 29 cases would have required fire sprinklers. Of those 0,
only 3 would have been required to be sprinklered under the old amendments. Therefore, only
an additional 10% of the total number would require fire sprinklers with the Modification Factor
set at 2.0. If the Modification Factor is reduced to 1.25, then an additional 4, for a total of 10
cases, or 34% of the total cases, would have required fire sprinklers, keeping in mind that 3 of
those 10 would have required fire sprinklers under the current amendments so only an additional
24% would have required fire sprinklers.

Additional to the discussion above, staff recommends one other revision to the previously reviewed and
approve Fire Code amendments. Due to the potential for fire in larger food service establishments, staff
recommends that food service establishments be reclassified from the current hazard classification of 3
for assembly or business use groups within the definition of HAZARD CATEGORIES AND
CLASSIFICATIONS under IFC Section 202 (See Item 16 of Attachment IFC-3). We recommend that
all new food service establishments with commercial kitchen hood and duct systems where the number
of employees plus seats for patrons exceeds 10 be classified as a level 3 occupancy. This would require
such food service establishments built in tenant spaces previously occupied by general businesses or
other lower hazard occupancies to be equipped with fire sprinklers, particularly to increase the level of
fire safety within the Village’s downtown district.

Recommendation:

1. We recommend that the Building Board of Appeals approve a motion to adopt the proposed
revisions to the previously reviewed and approved amendments as presented herein above or as
may be amended through discussion at the June 15, 2022, meeting.

i Hard Cost defined under Village Code Section 5-2-1(B) reads as follows:

HARD COST. The cost of all labor, materials, overhead and profit to complete remodeling of an existing building.
Remodeling work includes, but is not limited to, improvements and alterations to foundations, walls, roofs, floors,
ceilings, stairs, doors, windows, and electrical, mechanical, plumbing systems and fixtures and equipment.
For purpose of determining hard cost, remodeling work does not include the following:
1. Interior or exterior non-structural demolition work or removal of existing improvements, fixtures or equipment.
2. Work to install a fire sprinkler system or increase the size of the water service to a building as required to serve a
fire sprinkler system.
3. Work to install a fire alarm and detection system.
4. Installation of interior floor, wall and ceiling finishes such as paint, wallcoverings, paneling or tile over wallboard, or
carpet, wood or tile flooring over a subfloor.
5. Cabinets and casework, countertops, shelving units, or door, window, base and ceiling trim.
6. Furniture, appliances, decorative fixtures, window treatments or business sales, display or service fixtures and
equipment.

X:\Plandev\Witt\2018 Code Upgrade\Meeting 8\Final\Staff Repott - Building Codes Upgrade Meeting 8 - 061522.docx
Page 3 of 4

Page 22 of 68



i Crain’s Chicago Business reported in March 2020 that construction costs in Chicago were 19.4 percent higher than the
national average, see Attachment A.

i See Attachment F.

¥ The International Code Council is the author of the Village’s base building codes.

v International Code Council Building Valuation Data, see Attachment B.

Vi See Attachment B.

vi Turner & Townsend, International Construction Market Survey 2019, see Attachment C.

Vit National Association of Home Builders, Cost of Constructing a Home, Special Studies, January 2, 2020, see Attachment D.
ix See columns added in Attachment E to the right of the NAHB spreadsheet.

Att:  Attachment A: Crain’s Chicago Business, Chicago construction costs third-highest in country,

March 05, 2020

Attachment B: International Code Council, Building V alnation Data — Augnst 2021

Attachment C: Turner & Townsend, International Construction Market Survey 2019

Attachment D: National Association of Home Builders, Cosz of Constructing a Home, Special
Studies, Janunary 2, 2020

Attachment E: Calculation of Project Hard Cost, based on NAHB Single Family Price and
Cust Breakdowns, 2019 National

Attachment F: Fire Sprinkler Modification Factor Analysis

Attachment IFC-2:  Fire Code — Proposed Revisions to Amendments Previously Approved by
the BBA (Redlined)

Attachment IFC-3:  Fire Code — Proposed Revisions to Amendments Previously Approved by
the BBA (Clean)

X:\Plandev\Witt\2018 Code Upgrade\Meeting 8\Final\Staff Repott - Building Codes Upgrade Meeting 8 - 061522.docx
Page 4 of 4

Page 23 of 68



Attachment - A

CRAIN'S CHICAGO BUSINESS

You may not reproduce, display on a website, distribute, sell or republish this article or data, or the
information contained therein, without prior written consent. This printout and/or PDF is for personal

usage only and not for any promotional usage. © Crain Communications Inc.
March 05, 2020 11:46 AM

Chicago construction costs third-highest in country

Only New York and San Francisco have higher costs than the local market, according to a
recent report that also found construction costs here have risen 31.6 percent over the past
decade.

ALBY GALLUN

Alby Gallun

Apartment projects, like this one underway at Randolph Street and Wabash Avenue in a photo from March, have kept construction companies busy
in the Chicago area, but the market is slowing.

Only New York and San Francisco have higher costs than the local market, according to a
recent report that also found construction costs here have risen 31.6 percent over the past
decade.

Chicago, the nation’s third-biggest metro area, also ranks third when it comes what
developers pay to put up office, apartment and other buildings.

Only New York and San Francisco have higher construction costs than the Chicago market,
according to a report from Jones Lang LaSalle. Construction costs here have risen 31.6
percent over the past decade, more than any other metro area in the Midwest but less than
several others in the country, especially those on the West Coast, the report shows.

JLL offers a relatively benign outlook for the U.S. construction market, which has delivered
hefty profits over the past decade for a wide range of businesses, from electrical and HVAC
contractors to companies that supply concrete to high-rise developers. In the Chicago area,
construction companies have been busy building apartments—more than 27,000 units just in
downtown since 2010—health care facilities and huge warehouses in the southwest
suburbs.

But JLL doesn’t expect big things for the industry in 2020, forecasting that total
nonresidential construction spending across the country will rise less than 2 percent.

Page 24 of 68



Attachment - A

“The coming year is expected to be a stable one for the overall construction industry, but with
little growth and with key stats like construction volume and employment holding steady,” the
report says.

JLL doesn’t provide an outlook for Chicago, but an earlier forecast from research firm Dodge
Data & Analytics predicted a 10 percent decline in construction spending here, the third
decline in four years.

Nationally, JLL isn’t counting on much lift from the private sector.

“In an environment where nearly all growth is coming from public dollars, the sectors
expected to do well will be those with the most public investment, including transportation,
education, health care and public safety,” the report says. “The reverse will also be true, with
sectors that rely heavily on private investment, like hospitality and retail, expected to see the
weakest growth.”

JLL, a Chicago-based real estate services firm, expects construction costs to increase 1 to 3
percent this year. A national building cost index rose 1.5 percent in 2019, with construction
wages up 2.2 percent. Price changes on construction materials varied, with concrete
products prices rising 3.3 percent and prices of steel mill products falling 14.2 percent,
according to the report. Aluminum prices fell 4.7 percent.

“The combination of easing trade tensions and weaker demand from industries other than
construction were the major factors leading to the declining prices of those two
commodities,” the report says.

The report also considers the potential impact of the coronavirus on the construction
industry, which relies heavily on imports from China, where the outbreak is the most severe.

“As a very broad estimate, roughly between one-quarter and one-third of all construction
products in the U.S. are sourced from China, so any sustained slowdown in Chinese
production may cause material shortages in the U.S. and could lead to increased costs for
construction materials,” the report says. “Alternatively, if reduced construction activity due to
virus containment efforts causes a major reduction in demand for materials from China, the
U.S. or other countries, the reduction in demand may offset or outweigh the upward price
pressure.”

Construction costs in Chicago were 19.4 percent higher than the national average. Only New
York, at 31.7 percent, and San Francisco, at 29 percent, were higher, according to JLL.

Page 25 of 68



Attachment - A

Knoxville, Tenn., is the least expensive place to build, with costs there 18.3 percent below
the national average.

Among Midwestern metro areas, costs rose the most in Chicago over the past decade, at
31.6 percent—about 2.8 percent annually—followed by Milwaukee, at 27.7 percent, and
Indianapolis, 27.3 percent.

Inline Play

Source URL: https://www.chicagobusiness.com/commercial-real-estate/chicago-construction-costs-
third-highest-country

Page 26 of 68



Attachment - B

i | NTERNATIONAL
CODE COUNCIL

Same

People Helping People Build a Safer World

Building Valuation Data — AUGUST 2021

The International Code Council is pleased to provide the
following Building Valuation Data (BVD) for its members. The
BVD will be updated at six-month intervals, with the next
update in February 2022. ICC strongly recommends that all
jurisdictions and other interested parties actively evaluate and
assess the impact of this BVD table before utilizing it in their
current code enforcement related activities.

The BVD table provides the “average" construction costs per
square foot, which can be used in determining permit fees for
a jurisdiction. Permit fee schedules are addressed in Section
109.2 of the 2021 International Building Code (IBC) whereas
Section 109.3 addresses building permit valuations. The
permit fees can be established by using the BVD table and a
Permit Fee Multiplier, which is based on the total construction
value within the jurisdiction for the past year. The Square Foot
Construction Cost table presents factors that reflect relative
value of one construction classification/occupancy group to
another so that more expensive construction is assessed
greater permit fees than less expensive construction.

ICC has developed this data to aid jurisdictions in determining
permit fees. It is important to note that while this BVD table
does determine an estimated value of a building (i.e., Gross
Area x Square Foot Construction Cost), this data is only
intended to assist jurisdictions in determining their permit fees.
This data table is not intended to be used as an estimating
guide because the data only reflects average costs and is not
representative of specific construction.

This degree of precision is sufficient for the intended purpose,
which is to help establish permit fees so as to fund code
compliance activities. This BVD table provides jurisdictions
with a simplified way to determine the estimated value of a
building that does not rely on the permit applicant to determine
the cost of construction. Therefore, the bidding process for a
particular job and other associated factors do not affect the
value of a building for determining the permit fee. Whether a
specific project is bid at a cost above or below the computed
value of construction does not affect the permit fee because
the cost of related code enforcement activities is not directlty
affected by the bid process and results.

Building Valuation

The following building valuation data represents average
valuations for most buildings. In conjunction with IBC Section
109.3, this data is offered as an aid for the building official to
determine if the permit valuation is underestimated. Again it
should be noted that, when using this data, these are
“average” costs based on typical construction methods for
each occupancy group and type of construction. The average
costs include foundation work, structural and nonstructural

building components, electrical, plumbing, mechanical and
interior finish material. The data is a national average and
does not take into account any regional cost differences. As
such, the use of Regional Cost Modifiers is subject to the
authority having jurisdiction.

Permit Fee Multiplier

Determine the Permit Fee Multiplier:

1. Based on historical records, determine the total annual
construction value which has occurred within the
jurisdiction for the past year.

2. Determine the percentage (%) of the building
department budget expected to be provided by
building permit revenue.

Bldg. Dept. Budget x (%)

Permit Fee Multiplier =
Total Annual Construction Value

Example

The building department operates on a $300,000 budget, and
it expects to cover 75 percent of that from building permit fees.
The total annual construction value which occurred within the
jurisdiction in the previous year is $30,000,000.

$300,000 x 75%

Permit Fee Multiplier = =0.0075

$30,000,000
Permit Fee

The permit fee is determined using the building gross area, the
Square Foot Construction Cost and the Permit Fee Multiplier.

Permit Fee = Gross Area x Square Foot Construction Cost
X Permit Fee Muitiplier

Example

Type of Construction: 11B
Area: 1ststory = 8,000 sq. ft.
2nd story = 8,000 sq. ft.
Height: 2 stories
Permit Fee Multiplier = 0.0075
Use Group: B
1. Gross area:
Business = 2 stories x 8,000 sq. ft. = 16,000 sq. ft.
2. Square Foot Construction Cost:
B/IIB = $213.38/sq. ft.
3. Permit Fee:
Business = 16,000 sq. ft. x $213.38/sq. ft x 0.0075
= $25,606

Page 27 of 68



Attachment - B

Important Points

The BVD is not intended to apply to alterations or
repairs to existing buildings. Because the scope of
alterations or repairs to an existing building varies so
greatly, the Square Foot Construction Costs table
does not reflect accurate values for that purpose.
However, the Square Foot Construction Costs table
can be used to determine the cost of an addition that is
basically a stand-alone building which happens to be
attached to an existing building. In the case of such
additions, the only alterations to the existing building
would involve the attachment of the addition to the
existing building and the openings between the
addition and the existing building.

For purposes of establishing the Permit Fee Multiplier,
the estimated total annual construction value for a
given time period (1 year) is the sum of each building's
value (Gross Area x Square Foot Construction Cost)
for that time period (e.g., 1 year).

The Square Foot Construction Cost does not include
the price of the land on which the building is built. The
Square Foot Construction Cost takes into account
everything from foundation work to the roof structure
and coverings but does not include the price of the
land. The cost of the land does not affect the cost of
related code enforcement activities and is not included
in the Square Foot Construction Cost.

Square Foot Construction Costs =b.¢

Group (2021 International Building Code) 1A iB A IiB A nB v VA VB
A-1 Assembly, theaters, with stage 298.55 | 288.43 | 280.93 | 269.54 | 253.09 | 245.77 | 260.87 | 235.34 | 226.84
A-1 Assembly, theaters, without stage 273.51 | 263.39 | 255.89 | 244.51 | 228.06 | 220.73 | 235.84 | 210.31 | 201.80
A-2 Assembly, nightclubs 233.39 | 226.42 | 220.85 | 211.80 | 199.64 | 194.14 | 204.26 | 180.65 | 174.48
A-2 Assembly, restaurants, bars, banquet halls 232.39 | 225.42 | 218.85 | 210.80 | 197.64 | 193.14 | 203.26 | 178.65 | 173.48
A-3 Assembly, churches 276.84 | 266.72 | 259.22 | 247.83 | 231.83 | 225.68 | 239.17 | 214.08 | 205.57
A-3 Assembly, general, community halls, libraries,

museums 231.62 | 221.50 | 213.00 | 202.61 | 185.16 | 178.84 | 193.94 | 167.42 | 159.91
A-4 Assembly, arenas 272.51 | 262.39 | 253.89 | 243.51 | 226.06 | 219.73 | 234.84 | 208.31 | 200.80
B Business 240.93 | 232.14 | 224.41 | 213.38 | 194.94 | 187.44 | 204.97 | 171.50 | 163.65
E Educational 253.16 | 244.50 | 238.07 | 227.82 | 212.65 | 201.92 | 219.97 | 185.88 | 180.09
F-1 Factory and industrial, moderate hazard 142.51 | 135.81 | 128.20 | 123.31 | 110.60 | 105.32 | 118.02 | 91.13 | 85.44
F-2 Factory and industrial, low hazard 141.51 | 134.81 | 128.20 | 122.31 | 110.60 | 104.32 | 117.02 | 91.13 | 84.44
H-1 High Hazard, explosives 133.05 | 126.35 | 119.74 | 113.85 | 102.42 | 96.14 | 108.56 | 82.95| N.P.
H234 High Hazard 133.05 | 126.35 | 119.74 | 113.85 | 10242 | 96.14 | 108.56 | 82.95 | 76.26
H-5 HPM 240.93 | 232.14 | 224.41 | 213.38 | 194.94 | 187.44 | 204.97 | 171.50 | 163.65
I-1 Institutional, supervised environment 240.35 | 232.11 | 225.21 | 216.12 | 198.77 | 193.28 | 216.40 | 178.22 | 172.87
I-2 Institutional, hospitals 403.60 | 394.81 | 387.08 | 376.05 | 356.54 | N.P. | 367.65] 333.11 | N.P.
-2 Institutional, nursing homes 280.29 | 271.50 | 263.77 | 252.74 | 235.00 | N.P. | 244.34 | 21157 | N.P.
I-3 Institutional, restrained 273.98 | 265.19 | 257.46 | 246.43 | 229.58 | 221.08 | 238.03 | 206.14 | 196.29
I-4 Institutional, day care facilities 240.35 | 232.11 | 225.21 | 216.12 | 198.77 | 193.28 | 216.40 | 178.22 | 172.87
M Mercantile 174.08 | 167.12 | 160.55 | 152.50 | 140.10 | 135.60 | 144.96 | 121.12 | 115.94
R-1 Residential, hotels 242.77 | 234.53 | 227.63 | 218.55 | 200.90 | 195.42 | 218.82 | 180.35 | 175.00
R-2 Residential, multiple family 203.34 | 195.11 | 188.20 | 179.12 | 162.64 | 157.15 | 179.40 | 142.08 | 136.73
R-3 Residential, one- and two-family ¢ 189.34 | 184.22 | 179.47 | 175.04 | 169.94 | 163.79 | 172.07 | 157.66 | 148.33
R-4 Residential, care/assisted living facilities 240.35 | 232.11 | 225.21 | 216.12 | 198.77 | 193.28 | 216.40 | 178.22 | 172.87
S-1 Storage, moderate hazard 132.05 | 125.35 | 117.74 | 112.85 | 100.42 | 95.14 | 107.56 | 80.95| 75.26
S-2 Storage, low hazard 131.05 | 124.35 | 117.74 | 111.85 | 10042 | 94.14 | 106.56 | 80.95| 74.26
U Utility, miscellaneous 104.03 | 98.14 | 9246 | 88.40 | 79.71 73.77 | 8455| 62.84 | 59.88

aoow

Private Garages use Utility, miscellaneous

For shell only buildings deduct 20 percent

N.P. = not permitted

Unfinished basements (Group R-3) = $23.20 per sq. ft.

Page 28 of 68




Attachment - C

ﬂ Turner & Townsend

[E e
1 _‘.5:;'!5!_ k) 1
EER i' -3

[ .;. - -
Y oy,

R ST .,

{11
| _I_- _\Il__

-

e

making the difference




Attachment - C

1"1. [" W"_ g Contents
pd A ‘

» Overview
g 2 Survey overview
- and highlights
6 Global economic outiook

10 Global construction
cost performance

22 Market challenges: the trade
wars ripple effect

Around the globe
26 Kenya
28 Rwanda

30 South Africa
32 Tanzania
34 Uganda
36 Zimbabwe

China
India
Indonesia
46 Japan

48 Malaysia
50 Singapore
South Korea
Vietnam

Australia
New Zealand

Europe
60 Austria
62 France

64 Germany
66 freland
68 Netherlands
70 Poland
72 Russia
74 Spain

) 76 Sweden

Le 78  Switzerland

Turkey

Oman

88 Qatar

90 Saudi Arabia
92 UAE

94 Canada

96 Mexico

98 USA

South America
104 Argentina
106 Brazil
108 Chile
110 Colombia

Methodology

112 Comparing construction costs
114 Terms and references

Page 30 of 68



Overview

Attachment - C

Economic turmoil is not a barrier to growth

In the last 12 months, the economic
backdrop has shifted. The International
Monetary Fund has cut its forecast for
global economic growth, stock markets
have retreated, and house price
inflation has slowed.

Added to this, political turmoil and
trade-war tensions have increased
uncertainty and volatility within global
markets, with tariffs directly affecting
the construction sector.

Despite these headwinds, the global
construction sector entered this year
with significant momentum, having

seen growth of five percent in 2018.

Prospects throughout 2019

are equally buoyant - our 2019
international construction market
survey reveals 28 percent of markets
are hot or overheating and a further
36 percent continue to warm up. Just
eight percent are cooling, indicating
widespread and continued growth

in workload throughout the year.

Demand - a double-edged sword
Increasing activity and demand,

in an aiready hot market, presents
both opportunities and challenges
for the construction industry and
its customers. On one hand, strong
growth in construction will help
support economic growth, reducing
the potential of a major downturn.
This could cushion some of the
negative impacts on the sector and
help maintain favourable conditions
for business in many markets,

The challenge is, as hotter markets
become more overstretched, escalating
construction costs and tighter labour
markets will increasingly frustrate
attempts to deliver projects to desired
standards, cost and timeframes.

This will also put pressure on the
price gap between markets, which
have also widened. In 2018, the cost
of constructing one building in the ten
most expensive markets was
equivalent to delivering four buildings
within the bottom ten markets. In
2019 that cost gap has grown to five,

No time for complacency

A future easing of economic growth
may indeed take some heat out of

the market. But while this may provide
some relief, the symptoms of an
overstretched sector — cost overruns,
delays in delivery and an erosion of
quality - should not be ignored.

We cannot hide from the increasing
volatility markets are experiencing.
Nor can we ignore growing impatience
that construction is not adapting or
improving fast enough. We continue
to face some fundamental issues.

Clients and suppliers equally have

an opportunity — and a responsibility

- to drive productivity through new
innovations in building, developing new
ways of working and business models,
using technology in a smarter way and
developing new skills for. the future. As
a sector filled with pride and ambition,
now is our time to shine.

Against this backdrop of rising costs
and market volatility, it is time to join
forces across the industry, identify
levers, mobilise and accelerate change.
By doing this together, we can benefit
collectively from the whole industry and
our ability to deliver next generation
real estate solutions for all. Combining
this with which markets offer the most
attractive conditions for investment,
both in terms of the potential for
construction today and with a view

to future growth, may yield
unexpected results.

Neil Bullen
Global Managing Director, Real Estate

neil bullen@turntown.com

Page 31 of 68



Overview
Survey overview and highlights

Attachment - C

About our survey

Our 2019 International construction market survey (ICMS) brings
together data and experience from 64 global markets. It is our largest
and most in-depth survey to date, providing insights into the current

state and direction of the global construction industry.

Our 2019 survey draws on
construction data and analysis from
real estate projects around the world,
providing asset investors and owners
with an even greater insight to the
constantly changing dynamics of global
construction activity. With the addition
of 18 new markets, this year’s survey
now encompasses 84 percent of

global GDP.

Markets in new countries inciuded
in this year’s survey are:

= Auckland and Christchurch
~ New Zealand

= Harare - Zimbabwe

= Mexico City - Mexico

= Riyadh - Saudi Arabia

= Stockholm - Sweden

= Vienna - Austria.

The additions of key markets within
countries already covered in the survey
enables more comprehensive cross-
country comparisons to be drawn.

This year, these are:

Atlanta, Chicago, Indianapolis

and Phoenix - USA

= Vancouver, Ottawa and
Edmonton - Canada

= Berlin and Frankfurt, Germany
and Barcelona, Spain - Europe

= Guangzhou - China.

2018 was the peak of the global
construction cycle that started in 2009,
following the global financial crisis.

As a result, the construction sector
has begun 2019 with considerable
momentum. This impetus should
continue to help support the global
economy during the year. Of the
markets surveyed, 28 percent are

2 International construction
market survey 2019

hot or overheating and a further
36 percent continue to warm up.

Global economic turmoil will continue;
markets stumbled at the end of 2018,
Brexit is in full swing and trade wars
are impacting. But the strength of
construction in many markets shown
in our survey indicates that they may
be cushioned from the full effects of
any economic downturn.

Our research gathers data on market
conditions, as well as challenges

and opportunities our local experts
are seeing on the ground. We also
analyse input costs such as labour
and materials, and the average cost
per square metre across different
construction types from residential
to commercial.

A variety of construction cost
comparison methodologies are
adopted to ensure our findings

deliver accuracy and insight. As well
as straight-line USD conversion, we
also use purchasing power parity (PPP)
and location factors. These methods
remove the impact from changing
exchange rates, to standardise our
data and draw valid conclusions.

@ For maore information on the
methods we use see pages H2 and 113
Detailed explanations of what's included
and excluded from our cost information
is given on page 114.

i

Page 32 of 68



Around the globe
North America

-

SA

Chicago,
Indianapolis and
Houston

Uncertainty clouds sound economic

fundamentals

Attachment - C

Economic overview

The mood in the central states of the
USA is mixed. Unemployment is down
to below 4 percent and real wage
growth is supportive.

But as the Chicago Fed Survey of
Business Conditions shows, business
sentiment is volatile. It saw optimism
dive in 2018 following tricky trade
negotiations and the government
shutdown.

Construction market and trends
Construction in Chicago, Indianapolis
and Houston is growing, workforces
have expanded in all these cities.
Labour costs are high in Chicago and
Indianapolis has a skills shortage.

Top-performing sectors in Chicago
currently include office development

and sports, leisure and hospitality, with

transport performing relatively well.

High-profile projects, including the
johmn.robbins@turntown.com

Chicago Indianapolis Houston
usp uso UsD
International building costs per m? of internal area, in 2018 (m?) (n" {m?} (ft2) (m?) ()

Airports (Building only)
Domestic terminal, full service
Low-cost carrier terminal, basic service

576
322

6,195
3,465

5,523
3,090

513
287

5,162
2,887

480
268

Multi-storey - above ground
Multi-storey - below ground

792 74
1,537 143

605 56
1,174 109

565 53
1,098 102

Offices - Business Park 1,652 154 1,348 125 1,322 123
CBD Offices - up to 20 floors medium (A-Grade) 3,182 296 2,318 215 2,273 211
CBD Offices - high-rise prestige 5,091 473 3,709 345 3,636 338

232
352

Primary and secondary
University

2,500
3,788

2,465
3,486

229
324

2,448
3,258

228
303

Day centre (including basic surgeries) 3,071 285 2,528 235 2,363 220
Regional hospital 4,719 439 3,271 304 3,057 284
General hospital (e.g, city teaching hospital) 4,916 457 4,039 375 37S 351

3 Star travellers 2,406 224 1,839 171 1,718 160
5 Star luxury 5,277 490 4,033 375 3,770 350
Resort style 3,139 292 2,488 231 2,325 216

978 91
1,224 114
4,300 400

712 66
1,040 97
3,928 365

Warehouse/factory units — basic
Large warehouse distribution centre
High-tech factory/laboratory

698 65
1,020 95
4,911 456

Individual detached or terrace style house - medlum standard 1,730 161 1,470 137 1,441 134
Individual detached house - prestige 3,958 368 2,884 268 2,827 263
Townhouses — medium standard 1,264 117 1,074 100 1,053 98
Apartments - low-rise medium standard 1,570 146 1,334 124 1,308 122
Apartments - high-rise 2,054 191 1,676 156 1,643 153
Aged care/affordable units 1,428 133 1,267 118 1,242 115

Large shopping centre including mall 3,343 311 2,842 264 2,786 259
Neighbourhood including supermarket 1,613 150 1,266 118 1,241 115
Prestige car showroom 3,350 311 3,104 288 3,043 283

International construction
market survey 2019

100

Page 33 of 68



”
- -
- -
‘"___. . :
.
i %
[T
—
—
—
——— -
L Ty et
1
L}
L]
.
-
T
ia
i‘
ik
i
Ay
4

Turner & T:Rk’nse"a T!{:E?Indepqu_r Luraﬁes;__ghl services
company spemallsing n programme management project
management cos'.'ﬂndrcemmerc{élrm;dnagement and advisory

. agLoss fﬁgieal estate, infrastructure and.naﬁgtél resources settdts,

With 108 offices in 45 countriesywe draw on aur e;genswe glohal...
and industry experience to'manage risk while. mammmngﬁﬁre
.and performance during the construction and operation of our
clients’ assets.

www.turnerandtownsend.com

® Turner & Townsend. All rights reserved April 2019. This content is for
general information purposes only and does not purport to constitute
professional advice. We do not make any representation or give any
warranty and shall not be liable for any losses or damages whatsoever,
arlsing from reliance on information contained In this document.

IR



Attachment - D

Cost of Constructing a Home

Special Studies January 2, 2020
By Carmel Ford

NAHB Economics and Housing Policy Group

Introduction

Over the years, NAHB has periodically conducted “construction cost surveys” to collect information from builders on the
various components that go into the sales price of a typical single-family home. NAHB’s most recent Construction Cost
survey (conducted in the fall of 2019) shows that, on average, 61.1 percent of the sales price goes to construction costs and
18.5 percent to finished lot costs. On average, builder profit is 9.1 percent of the sales price.

Of the major stages of construction, interior finishes, at 25.4 percent, accounts for the largest share of construction costs,
followed by framing at 17.4 percent. These percentages cover all costs paid by a builder, including labor, materials, and
the cost of hiring subcontractors.

The following sections describe the methodology of the survey and discuss the results in more detail.

Methodology

NAHB’s 2019 Construction Cost survey was conducted by emailing a questionnaire to a representative sample of 6,516
home builders. The sample was stratified by the size of the builder (based on the number of 2018 single-family starts) and
by region of the country (the sample being proportional to housing starts in each of the four principal Census regions).

Over the years, NAHB has modified the survey and its methodology. In 2009, the survey methodology changed to provide
a better, more representative sample of single-family construction across the country. In 2013, NAHB developed a different
construction cost breakdown that more closely resembles the steps that builders take when building a home. Prior to 2013,
the breakdown had 29 sections. In 2013, we created eight subcategories for each of the major stages of construction, with
a total of 36 sections grouped under the appropriate construction stage. The new format simplified data collection, greatly
reducing the number of follow-up calls needed to clarify and verify builder responses.

Respondents were asked to provide information about the typical single-family home built by their firms during 2019.
Usable responses were received from 49 builders. Table 1 shows the detailed results of the 2019 Construction Cost survey.

.

Page 35 of 68



Attachment - D

Table 1. Single Family Price and Cost Breakdowns

2019 National Results

I. Sale Price Breakdown

A. Finished Lot Cost (including financing cost)
B. Total Construction Cost

C. Financing Cost

D. Overhead and General Expenses

E. Marketing Cost

F. Sales Commission

G. Profit

Total Sales

I1. Construction Cost Breakdown

I. Site Work (sum of A to E)

A. Building Permit Fees

B. Impact Fee

C. Water & Sewer Fees Inspections

D. Architecture, Engineering

E. Other

IL. Foundations (sum of F to G)

F. Excavation, Foundation, Concrete, Retaining walls, and Backfill
G. Other

III. Framing (sum of H to L)

H. Framing (including roof)

I. Trusses (if not included above)

J. Sheathing (if not included above)

K. General Metal, Steel

L. Other

IV. Exterior Finishes (sum of M to P)
M. Exterior Wall Finish

N. Roofing

O. Windows and Doors (including garage door)
P. Other

V. Major Systems Rough-ins (sum of Q to T)
Q. Plumbing (except fixtures)

R. Electrical (except fixtures)

S.HVAC

T. Other

VL. Interior Finishes (sum of U to AE)
U. Insulation

V. Drywall

W. Interior Trims, Doors, and Mitrors
X. Painting

Y. Lighting

Z. Cabinets, Countertops

AA. Appliances

AB. Flooring

AC. Plumbing Fixtures

AD. Fireplace

AE. Other

VII. Final Steps (sum of AF to AJ)
AF. Landscaping

AG. Outdoor Structures (deck, patio, porches)
AH. Driveway

Al Clean Up

Al. Other

VIII. Other

Total

Averglg.e Lot Size:
11 L

Ave.ra ge
$89,540
$296.,652
$8.160
$23.683
$4.895
$18.105

$44.0

92

Average
$18,323

$5.086
$3.865
$4.319
$4.335
$719
$34.850
$33.511
$1.338
$51.589
$40.612
$6.276
$3.216
$954
$530
$41.690
$19.319
$9.954
$11,747
$671
$43.668
$14.745
$13.798
$14.111
$1.013
$75.259
$5.184
$10.634
$10,605
$8.254
$3.437
$13,540
$4.710
$11,998
$4.108
$1.867
$923
$20.116
$6.506
$3.547
$6.674
$2,988
$402
$11.156
$296,652

Page 36 of 68



Attachment - D

Home and Lot Size

The average single-family home size in the 2019 NAHB Construction Cost Survey is 2,594 square feet of finished floor
space, the smallest square footage since 2011. Historically, average square footage in the NAHB survey has tended to move
in the same direction as in the Census Bureau’s series with a lag, and with wider fluctuations, as you would expect from the
smaller sample size.

The average home size dropped from 2,716 square feet in 2009 to 2,311 square feet in 2011, as demand eroded after the
Great Recession. As the economy recovered, it rose steadily and peaked at 2,802 square feet in 2015. Since then, the average
square footage has trended downward, dropping to 2,776 in 2017 and to 2,594 in 2019 (Graph 1). Data from the Census
Bureau corroborates this trend: the average size of all new homes peaked in 2015 at 2,740 square feet, but has
declined every year since then The smaller square footage in recent years is evidence that builders are shifting toward the
production of more entry-level homes to meet demand for more affordable homes.

Graph 1. SIZE OF SINGLE-FAMILY HOMES
(Square Footage)

2,900
2,802

ol

2,700
2,600 2623 594

2,500

2,400

2402 2408
2,300 B 2311

2,200
2,100

2,000
2008 2009 2010 2011 2012 2013 2014 2015 2016 2017 2018 2019

== (haracteristics of New Single-Family Homes Completed =@=NAHB Survey

The average lot size in the 2019 NAHB Construction Cost Survey is 22,094 square feet, or about a half-acre (1 acre is
equivalent to 43,560 square feet). This is the highest average lot size recorded in the survey’s history. The average lot size
was in the territory of 20,000 to 22,000 square feet in 2009 and 2011, but dropped to 14,359 sq. ft. in 2013. It rebounded to
20,129 sq. ft. in 2015, but dropped again to 11,186 sq. ft. in 2017, the smallest lot size since the inception of the survey.

In general, lot size in the NAHB survey has tended to move in the same direction as the Census series, but again with more
volatility from year to year (Graph 2). The Census data show a downward trend in lot size between 2009 and 2013, dropping
from an average of 18,871 sq. ft. to a low of 15,167 sq. ft. in 2013. It rebounds to 16,381 sq. ft. in 2015, but falls again to
another low of 14,539 sq. ft in 2018.

The NAHB survey shows a significant increase in lot size in 2019, which deviates from the downward trend exhibited by
the Census data. Again, this may reflect the Construction Cost survey’s small sample size.

Page 37 of 68



22,000

20,000

18,000

16,000

14,000

12,000

10,000

Sales Price

Attachment - D

Graph 2. LOT SIZE OF SINGLE-FAMILY HOMES
(Square Footage)

m 21,879 22,094

m 20,129

16,356 16,381

m 14,359

E 11,186

2009 2010 2011 2012 2013 2014 2015 2016 2017 2018 2019

== Characteristics of New Single-Family Homes Completed =i#=NAHB Survey

The average single-family home sales price in the 2019 NAHB Construction Cost Survey is $485,128, the highest average
sales price (not adjusted for inflation) in the survey’s history. The Census Bureau’s series shows the average price for new
single-family homes sold increasing steadily after the Great Recession, going from $267,900 in 2011 to $384,900 in
2017, and leveling off at $385,000 in 2018 (Graph 3). It is important to note that home price appreciation slowed in 2018
as higher mortgage interest rates softened demand for housing. Price growth reaccelerated in 2019, however, as
mortgage rates dropped to record lows and the labor market continued to expand.

Compared to the Census series, the NAHB survey data show a similar upward trend, but with bigger jumps in the average
price. Again, the larger fluctuations in the NAHB surveys are most likely due to the smaller sample size. The relatively
simple geographic stratification (four Census regions) may also be a factor.

Page 38 of 68



Attachment - D

Graph 3. SALES PRICE OF SINGLE-FAMILY HOMES

$500,000 $485, 1.28
m$468,318

$450,000
B $427,892

$400,000 ] $399’532 $384,900 $385,000

m $377,624 . $360,9

$350,000
$352,700

m $310,619 - $324,500

$300,000

$270,900 $292.200

$250,000 $272,900  $267,900

$200,000
2009 2010 2011 2012 2013 2014 2015 2016 2017 2018 2019

== Characteristics of New Single-Family Homes Sold ® NAHB Survey

Sales Price Breakdown

A key feature of the NAHB survey is that it asks builders to break down the sales price of their homes into seven categories:
finished lot cost; total construction cost; financing cost; overhead and general expenses; marketing costs; sales commission;
and profit. Table 2 contains historical information on the sales price breakdown of a single-family home. It is important to
remind readers to use caution when comparing data across years in Table 2, as trends may be affected by the survey’s sample
size limitations and the fact that a different set of builders responds to the survey each time.

On average in the 2019 NAHB survey, 61.1 percent of the final house price was attributable to construction costs, 18.5
percent to the cost of the finished lot, 4.9 percent to overhead and general expenses, 3.7 percent to sales commissions, 1.7
percent to financing costs, 1.0 percent to marketing costs, leaving 9.1 percent for profit (prior to taxes).

As a share of the average sales price, construction costs rose significantly, going from 55.6 percent in 2017 to 61.1 percent
in 2019. At the same time, the finished lot cost share decreased from 21.5 percent to 18.5 percent, and the average profit

margin fell from 10.7 percent to 9.1 percent.

Table 2. SINGLE-FAMILY HOMES SALES PRICE BREAKDOWN HISTORY
Sale Price Breakdown 1998 2002 2004 2007 2009 2011 2013 2015 2019
1. Finished Lot Cost 23.6%  235%  260% @ 245% @ 203% < 217% @ 186%  182%  215%  185%
2. Total Construction Cost 548%  508%  51.7%  481%  589%  593%  6L.7%  61.8%  55.6%  6L1%
1.9% 2.1% 1.8% 2.4% 1.7% 2.1% 1.4% 1.3% 1.8% L7%

3. Financing Cost

4. Overhead and General Expenscs 5.7% 5.5% 5.8% 7.0% 5.4% 5.2% 4.3% 5.6% 5.1% 4.9%
5. Marketing Cost 1.4% 24% 1.9% 2.5% 1.4% 1.5% 1.1% 0.8% 1.2% 1.0%
6. Sales Commis sion 3.4% 37% 3.0% 4.3% 3.4% 33% 3.6% 32% 4.1% 3.7%
1. Profit 9.2% 12.0% 9.8% 11.2% 8.95% 6.8% 9.3% 9.0% 10.7% 9.1%

$226,680 $298,412 $373,349 $454,906 $377,624 $310,619 $399,532 $468,318 $427,892 $485,128

8. Total Sales Price ($)
Source: NAHB Construction Cost Surveys, 1998-2019

Page 39 of 68



Attachment - D

Construction Costs

The average construction cost of a typical single-family home in the 2019 survey is $296,652 (Table 3), or about $114 per
square foot. The cost of construction per square foot was $80 in 2011, $95 in 2013, $103 in 2015, and $86 in 2017.

Of the 8 major stages of construction, interior finishes, at 25.4 percent, accounts for the largest share of construction costs,
followed by framing (17.4 percent), major system rough-ins (14.7 percent), exterior finishes (14.1 percent), foundations
(11.8 percent), final steps (6.8 percent), site work (6.2 percent), and other costs (3.8 percent) (See Table 3 for a full
breakdown).

Each category in Table 3 includes all the costs paid by a builder that go into a particular item, including labor costs paid
directly by the general contractor, the cost of hiring subcontractors, and the cost of materials, however they are purchased.

Among the major stages, the share of construction costs that go to interior finishes shifted the most between 2017 and 2019,
falling from 28.6 percent to 25.4 percent. Meanwhile, foundations and major system rough-ins had the largest percentage
point increases from 2017 to 2019, rising 1.0 point to 11.8 percent and 0.9 points to 14.7 percent, respectively.
Rising foundation costs may reflect increases in the cost of ready mix concrete seen throughout 2019.

The cost of framing, on the other hand, remained essentially unchanged between 2017 (17.3 percent) and 2019

Of the detailed items in the NAHB survey, framing and trusses remain the largest share of construction costs. Together,
they account for 15.8 percent of 2019’s construction costs, slightly down from the 16.8 percent they represented in 2017. The
share of construction costs going to impact fees rose slightly from 0.9 percent in 2017 to 1.3 percent in 2019.
An Eyeonhousing.org post, which highlights the top challenges for builders in 2019, shows that a significant share of
builders (61 percent) continued to report impact/hook-up/inspection fees remain one of their top problems.

Page 40 of 68



Attachment - D

Table 3. SINGLE-FAMILY CONSTRUCTION COST BREAKDOWN HISTORY

Construction Cost Breakdown 1998 2002 2004 2007 2009 2013

I, Site Work (sum of A to E) 6.8% 5.6% 6.7% 6.2%

A. Building Permit Fees 0.9% 1.3% 0.8% 1.7% 1.9% 1.7% 1.5% 1.2% 1.7% 1.7%

B. Impact Fee 1.0% 1.6% 1.1% 1.4% 1.4% 1.5% 1.3% 0.6% 0.9% 1.3%

C. Water & Sewer Fees Inspections 1.0% 1.4% 1.2% 1.6% 1.7% 1.6% 1.8% 1.4% 2.0% 1.5%

D. Architecture, Engineering 1.5% 1.6% 1.4% 1.5%

E. Other 0.7% 0.7% 0.7% 0.2%

II. Foundations (sum of F to G) 9.5% 11.6% 10.8% 11.7%
F. Excavation, Foundation, Concrete, 9.6% 6.9% 9.9% 7.0% 7.1% 9.3% 9.3% 11.3% 10.7% 11.3%
Retaining walls, and Backfill

G. Other 0.2% 0.3% 0.1% 0.5%

11I. Framing (sum of H to L) 191% 18.0% 173% 174%
H. Framing (including roof) 202% 184%  213% 15.8% 15.6% 13.5% 14.8% 15.4% 150%  13.7%
I. Trusses (if not included above) 22% 1.3% 1.6% 2.1%

J. Sheathing (if not included above) NA 0.9% 1.4% 1.6% 1.7% 1.2% 0.9% 0.4% 0.3% 1.1%

K. General Metal, Steel 1.1% 0.8% 0.3% 0.8% 0.7% 0.5% 0.7% 0.4% 0.3% 0.3%

L. Other 0.5% 0.3% 0.1% 0.2%

IV. Exterior Finishes (sum of M to P) 144% 150% 139% 14.1%
M. Exterior Wall Finish 6.8% 7.2% 6.5% 6.5%

N. Roofing 2.6% 2.6% 22% 3.2% 3.8% 29% 3.2% 3.5% 3.3% 3.4%

0. Windows and Doors (including garage door) 4.1% 42% 3.9% 4.0%

P. Other | 02% = 02%  03%  02%

V. Major Systems Rough-ins (sum of Q to T) 134% 13.1% 13.8% 14.7%
Q. Plumbing (except fixtures) 5.9% 5.4% 5.3% 5.4% 5.3% 6.0% 4.8% 43% 4.6% 5.0%

R. Electrical (except fixtures) 3.8% 3.3% 3.4% 3.9% 3.7% 4.4% 4.0% 42% 42% 4.7%

S.HVAC 41% 42% 3.7% 3.9% 4.0% 4.8% 4.5% 4.4% 4.7% 4.8%

T. Other 0.1% 0.3% 0.2% 0.3%

VI. Interior Finishes (sum of U to AE) 29.3% 29.6% 28.6% 254%
U. Insulation 1.4% 1.6% 1.4% 1.6% 1.5% 1.8% 1.9% 2.2% 2.2% 1.7%

V. Drywall 5.5% 5.3% 49% 5.1% 5.1% 4.4% 3.8% 4.1% 4.4% 3.6%

W. Interior Trims, Doors, and Mitrors 4.3% 4.3% 4.6% 3.6%

X. Painting 3.8% 3.6% 3.6% 3.4% 3.4% 3.3% 3.4% 3.1% 3.0% 2.8%

Y. Lighting 1.0% 0.8% 0.9% 1.0% 1.1% 1.2% 1.2% 1.2% 1.3% 1.2%

Z. Cabinets, Countertops 5.0% 43% 6.6% 5.7% 5.6% 5.6% 52% 5.5% 5.0% 4.6%

AA. Appliances 1.3% 1.2% 1.3% 1.7% 1.6% 2.0% 1.7% 1.5% 1.5% 1.6%

AB. Flooring 4.8% 43% 42% 5.0% 5.1% 4.5% 5.0% 4.6% 4.3% 4.0%

AC. Plumbing Fixtures 1.7% 1.5% 1.3% 1.4%

AD. Fireplace 0.8% 1.0% 0.6% 0.6%

AE. Other 0.2% 0.5% 0.4% 0.3%

VIL Final Steps (sum of AF to AJ) 6.6% 6.8% 7.0% 6.8%

AF. Landscaping 1.8% 2.5% 2.6% 2.8% 32% 3.5% 2.3% 2.1% 2.5% 2.2%

AG. Outdoor Structures (deck, patio, 0.7% 0.7% 1.0% 0.7% 0.9% 1.0% 1.2% 1.5% 1.3% 1.2%

porches)

AH. Driveway 1.5% 1.6% 1.3% 1.4% 1.4% 1.5% 1.5% 2.2% 1.9% 2.2%

Al Clean Up 0.9% 0.7% 1.1% 1.0%

Al. Other 0.7% 0.3% 0.3% 0.1%

VIIL. Other 0.9% 0.5% 2.0% 3.8%

Source: NAHB Construction Cost Surveys, 1998-2019

Page 41 of 68



Attachment - D

Caveats

These results are national averages; the survey sample is not large enough for a geographic breakdown. Building practices,
the cost of labor, the cost of land, and to some extent the cost of materials can vary from place to place and depend on the
nature of the particular home being built. Although the survey can provide a broad idea of construction costs for the average
new single-family home, it is not a perfect tool for estimating costs for a particular house. Companies that provide
more specific cost estimating, usually for a fee, include RSMeans (http:/rsmeans.reedconstructiondata.com/ ) and
Marshall & Swift (http://www.marshallswift.com/ ).

It is also important to note that because the NAHB Construction Cost Survey has a small sample size and does not control
for differences in the types of homes submitted in builders’ responses, users should exhibit caution when comparing
results across multiple years. For a more accurate time-series, users should refer to the Census Bureau’s Survey of
Construction, which is based on a much larger sample size and controls for home type.

Page 42 of 68



Attachment - E

Fire Sprinkler Modification Factor Analysis

Fable I, Single Family Price and Cost Breakdowns

2019 National

7-Jun-22

Project Coosts That Could
be Attributed to a Typical

Average Lot Size: 22,094 Home Addition Project
Average Finished Area:
1. Sale Price Breakdown Average Share of Price Total Cost Non-Hard
A. Finished Lot Cost (including financing cost) $89,540
B. Total Construction Cost $296,652 61.1%
C. Financing Cost $8,160 1.7%
D. Overhead and General Expenses $23,683 4.9% $23,683
E. Marketing Cost $4,895 1.0%
F. Sales Commission $18,105 3.7%
G. Profit 9.1% $44,092
Total Sales Price
I1. Construction Cost Breakdown / ¢ Sharcof
1. Site Work (sum of A to E) $18,323 6.2%
A. Building Permit Fees $5,086 1.7% $5,086
B. Impact Fee $3.865 1.3%
C. Water & Sewer Fees Inspections $4,319 1.5%
D. Architecture, Engineering $4,335 1.5% $4,335
E. Other $719 0.2% $719
I1. Foundations (sum of F to G) $34,850 11.8%
F. Excavation, Foundation, Concrete, Retaining walls, and Backfill $33,511 11.3% $33,511
G. Other $1,338 0.5% $1,338
II1. Framing (sum of H to L) $51,589 17.4%
H. Framing (including roof) $40,612 13.7% $40,612
I. Trusses (if not included above) $6,276 2.1% $6,276
J. Sheathing (if not included above) $3,216 1.1% $3,216
K. General Metal, Steel $954 0.3% $954
L. Other $530 0.2% $530
IV. Exterior Finishes (sum of M to P) $41,690 14.1%
M. Exterior Wall Finish $19,319 6.5% $19,319
N. Roofing $9,954 3.4% $9,954
O. Windows and Doors (including garage door) $11,747 4.0% $11,747
P. Other $671 0.2% 3671
V. Major Systems Rough-ins (sum of Q to T) $43,668 14.7%
Q. Plumbing (except fixtures) $14,745 5.0% $14,745
R. Electrical (except fixtures) $13,798 4.7% $13,798
S. HVAC $14,111 4.8% $14,111
T. Other $1,013 0.3% $1,013
VL. Interior Finishes (sum of U to AE) $75,259 25.4%
U. Insulation $5,184 1.7% $5,184
V. Drywall $10,634 3.6% $10,634
W. Interior Trims, Doors, and Mirrors $10,605 3.6% $10,605 $10,605
X. Painting $8,254 2.8% $8,254 $8,254
Y. Lighting $3,437 1.2% $3,437 $3,437
Z. Cabinets, Countertops $13,540 4.6% $13,540 $13,540
AA. Appliances $4,710 1.6% $4,710 $4,710
AB. Flooring $11,998 4.0% $11,998 $11,998
AC. Plumbing Fixtures $4,108 1.4% $4,108
AD. Fireplace $1,867 0.6% $1,867
AE. Other $923 0.3% $923
VIL. Final Steps (sum of AF to AJ) $20,116 6.8%
AF. Landscaping $6,506 2.2% $6,506
AG. Outdoor Structures (deck, patio, porches) $3,547 1.2% $3,547
AH. Driveway $6,674 2.2%
Al Clean Up $2,988 1.0% $2,988
AJ. Other $402 0.1% 3402
VIIL Other $11,156 3.8%
Total $296,652 100.0% $338,413 $52,544

Line items not generally applicable to home addition projects:
Line items not attributed to Hard Cost of project:
Hard Cost = $338,413-$52,433 = $285,869

Hard Cost % of Total = $285,869/8338,413 x 100 = 84.47, say 85%

X:\Plandev\Witt\2018 Code Upgrade\Meeting 8\[Calculation of Project Hard Cost based on NAHB.xIsx|Table 1

==
=S

Page 43 of 68



Fire Sprinkler Modification Factor Analysis 7-Jun-22

Proposed Buildings and Structures Modification Factor Analysis - see proposed amendment IFC 1103.5.9
Existing Areas’ Altered Areas’
Sprinklers required by current code
A B C D E F G H P10 ) K ° wm’ N® amendments?
Year Case |[Street Floor Wall Roof Floor Wall Roof Est. Cost [Hard Cost of E G+H J Modification Column F Columns G+H
of Addition | Addition C (D+E) 300,000 Factor® >2,500? C+F (D+E)
>5,000? | >.75?
1 |Main 4245 3260 3361 2302 510 3361 | 362,933 | 308,493 0.54 0.58 1.03 2.16 o 1 YES I no
2 |oak 1928 0 0 240 0 0 37,838 32,163 0.12 0.00 0.11 0.23 no | no | no
3 Linden 3540 4220 1970 115 108 0 18,131 15,411 0.03 0.02 0.05 0.10 no no no
~ 4 |Vine 1276 1929 1474 1783 1219 850 281,108 | 238,942 1.40 0.61 0.80 2.80 no no no
S 5 |Traver 2682 0 0 910 0 0 143,471 121,950 0.34 0.00 0.41 0.75 no no no
N 6 |Park 1983 NA NA 65 NA NA 10,248 8,711 0.03 0.00 0.03 0.06 no no no
7 |Cottage 1794 2257 3046 293 480 1542 46,194 39,265 0.16 0.38 0.13 0.68 no no no
8 |[crest 2824 3648 1466 1072 160 1466 169,012 143,660 0.38 0.32 0.48 1.18 no no no
9 Euclid 1465 1697 780 832 280 73 131,173 111,497 0.57 0.14 0.37 1.08 no no no >
10 [Em 1781 2038 1186 613 627 54 96,646 82,149 0.34 0.21 0.27 0.83 no no no
11 [Hill 1932 2780 957 864 1006 220 136,218 115,786 0.45 0.33 0.39 1.16 no __no_ | no 2
12 |Cottage 4435 3647 2550 600 9 280 94,596 80,407 0.14 0.05 0.27 0.45 no |__YES | no Q)
13 |Euclid 1246 2014 1260 1246 1194 1260 196,444 166,978 1.00 0.75 0.56 2.31 no no no O
14 |Roger 2289 1619 2289 370 129 86 58,334 49,584 0.16 0.06 0.17 0.38 no no no
15  |Cottage 2161 2564 1321 1297 749 647 204,485 173,812 0.60 0.36 0.58 1.54 no no no =
16  |Euclid 2455 1740 1176 1446 468 255 227,976 193,780 0.59 0.25 0.65 1.48 no no no 3
17 |park 2069 3194 1284 2661 1129 572 419,533 | 356,603 1.29 0.38 1.19 2.85 “ves_ 1 o no
- 18 |Hawthorne 2166 3068 1328 925 810 332 145,836 123,960 0.43 0.26 0.41 1.10 no no no (]
~ 19 [Newton 972 1992 1245 1245 168 972 196,287 166,844 1.28 0.35 0.56 2.19 no no no =S
S 20  [Newton 2039 212 1308 211 212 211 33,266 28,276 0.10 0.28 0.09 0.48 no no no =
21 |[crest 2190 2829 1412 739 550 355 116,511 99,034 0.34 0.21 0.33 0.88 no no no
22 |[Turner 4283 3781 1799 386 627 1514 60,857 51,728 0.09 0.38 0.17 0.65 no no no !
23 [crescent 3772 4805 4571 228 120 228 35,946 30,555 0.06 0.04 0.10 0.20 no no no |
24 |crest 2257 2552 2186 1434 738 717 226,084 192,172 0.64 0.31 0.64 1.58 no no no
25 |Main 2382 2006 2854 1227 1133 1494 193,449 164,431 0.52 0.54 0.55 1.60 no no no
26 |Hillside 2250 2130 1390 47 248 224 7,410 6,299 0.02 0.13 0.02 0.18 no no no
27 [Newton 1568 2086 1568 1482 103 1315 233,652 198,604 0.95 0.39 0.66 2.00 no no no
28 |Euclid 1465 1697 780 353 280 73 55,654 47,306 0.24 0.14 0.16 0.54 no no no
29 |waverly 1657 1927 2421 152 144 152 23,964 20,370 0.09 0.07 0.07 0.23 no no no
Notes: 1 Indicates existing areas prior to construction of addition, in square feet

2 Indicates proposed areas of construction (floor, wall or roof) that will be added or modified as part of the construction project, in square feet
3 Estimated cost of construction of the addition determined by the Building Valuation Data published by the International Code Council every six months
4 Estimated Hard Cost valued at 85% of the estimated cost of construction based on a review the 2019 National Results for Single Family Price and Cost Breakdowns published by the National
Association of Home Builders
5 Ratio of proposed additional square footage versus existing
6 Ratio of proposed altered surfaces (wall plus roof) versus existing
7 Hard Cost divided by fire sprinkler dollar threshold amount
8 Sum of values in columns K, L and M = Modification Factor
9 Fire Sprinklers would be required when the resulting Modification Factor is equal to or greater than 1.25
10 Construction costs for 2021 projects do not need to be increased for inflation since current cost/sf values were used for all cases, 2022 and 2021

X:\Plandev\Witt\2018 Code Upgrade\Meeting 8\Final\[Fire Sprinkler Modification Factor Analysis - 060722.xIsx]Sheet2

Page 44 of 68



Attachment IFC-2
Fire Code — Proposed Revisions to
Amendments Previously Approved by the BBA (Redlined)

5-2-1. Adoption of the Fire Code.

(A)  The 2018 ICC International Fire Code is adopted by reference as the standards and regulations for governing
the safeguarding of life and property from fire and explosion hazards arising from the storage, handling and
use of hazardous substances, materials and devices, and from conditions hazardous to life and property in
the occupancy of buildings and premises as this Code is intended, recommended, maintained and published
by the International Code Council except such portions thereof that are deleted, modified, or amended in
this chapter. At least one copy of the 2018 ICC International Fire Code shall be maintained on file in the
office of the Village Clerk for inspection and copying as a public record.

(B)  The provisions of the 2018 ICC International Fire Code are hereby deleted, modified, and amended as
follows:

1. Delete Section 101.1 in its entirety and substitute the following:

101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the fire code of the Village of Glen Ellyn hereinafter
referred to as "this Code".

2.  Amend Section 102.5 to add the following:

3. Fire protection systems and equipment provisions: All such provisions shall apply where specifically
prescribed in this Code for one- and two-family dwellings and townhouses.

3. Amend Section 102.7 to add the following at the end of the paragraph:

Exception: Wherever reference to the International Plumbing Code is made, substitute the Plumbing
Code, Department of Public Health, State of lllinois.

4. Amends Section 103 heading to read as follows:
SECTION 103 FIRE DEPARTMENT
5. Delete Section 103.1 in its entirety and substitute the following:

103.1 General. The Fire Department is established within the jurisdiction under the direction of the Fire
C-code Official. The function of the Fire Department shall be the implementation, administration, and
enforcement of the provisions of this Code in accordance with Title 5 Fire Regulations, Chapter 1 Fire
Department, in the Glen Ellyn Village Code.

6. Delete Sections 104.10 and 104.10.1 in their entirety and substitute the following:

104.10 Fire Investigations. The Fire Code Official shall investigate, or cause to be investigated, every fire
or explosion occurring within his jurisdiction that is of a suspicious nature, or which involves the loss of
life or serious injury or causes destruction or damage to property. Such investigation shall be initiated
immediately upon the occurrence of such fire or explosion; and if it appears that such an occurrence is
of a suspicious nature, the Fire Code Official shall immediately take charge of the physical evidence and,
in order to preserve physical evidence relating to the cause or origin of such fire or explosion, the Fire
Official shall take means to prevent access by any person to the structure or premises until such
evidence has been properly processed. The Fire Code Official shall notify those persons designated by
law to pursue investigations into such matters and shall further cooperate with the authorities in
collection of evidence and prosecution of the case and shall pursue the investigation to its conclusion.

X:\Plandev\Witt\2018 Code Upgrade\Meeting 8\Final\IFC-2 - Proposed Revisions to Amendments Previously
Approved by the BBA (Redlined).docx
Page 1 of 12

Page 45 of 68



Attachment IFC-2
Fire Code — Proposed Revisions to
Amendments Previously Approved by the BBA (Redlined)

7.

10.

11.

12.

13.

14.

15.

Add a new Section 104.12 to read as follows:

104.12 Fire Prevention Inspections. The Fire Code Official shall inspect all existing structures and
premises, except single-family dwellings, two-family dwellings, and individual dwelling units within
multi-family buildings, for the purpose of ascertaining and causing to be corrected any conditions liable
to cause fire, contribute to the spread of fire, interfere with fire-fighting operations, or endanger life or
any violation of the provisions or intent of this Code or any other ordinance affecting fire safety.

Renumber Section 108.1 to Section 109.1 as follows:

109.1 Board Of Appeals Established. The structure, responsibilities and procedures of the Building Board
of Appeals is established in Title 2 Boards and Commissions, Chapter 7 Building Board of Appeals, in the
Glen Ellyn Village Code.

Renumber Section 108.3 to Section 109.3 as follows: in its entirety and substitute the following:

109.3 Qualifications. The board of appeals shall consist of members who are qualified by experience
and training to pass on matters pertaining to hazards of fire, explosion, hazardous conditions, or fire
protection systems.

Renumber Section 109.3 to Section 110.4 as follows:

110.4 Violation Penalties. Any person who violates a provision of this Code shall, upon conviction
thereof, be subject to a fine of not less than $50.00 nor more than $750.00 unless a fine for the
violation of this Code is listed in the Village Code of Glen Ellyn, lllinois, then the more stringent shall
apply. Each day that a violation continues after due notice has been served shall be deemed a separate
offense.

Renumber Section 111.4 to Section 112.4 as follows:

112.4 Failure to Comply. Any person who shall continue any work after having been served with a stop
work order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe
condition, shall be liable to a fine of not less than $50.00 dollars or more than $750.00 dollars. Each day
that a violation continues after due notice has been served shall be deemed a separate offense.

Amend Section 202 to add the following use under Business Group B:
Co-working Facility
Amend Section 202 to add the definition of Co-working Facility to read as follows:

CO-WORKING FACILITY. A facility having more than (10) persons on site at any time, and in which food
and/or drink consumption occurs as part of the stated business plan before, during or after normal
business hours shall be classified as a Group A-2 occupancy.

Amend Section 202 to replace the definition of the Fire Code Official with the following:

Fire Code Official. The Fire Chief, the Building and Zoning Official or other designated authority charged
with the administration and enforcement of the Code, or a duly authorized representative, under the
direction and with the approval of the Director of Community Development or the Village Manager.

Amend Section 202 to add the definition of Hard Cost to read as follows:

HARD COST. The cost of all labor, materials, overhead and profit to complete remodeling of an existing
building. Remodeling work includes, but is not limited to, improvements and alterations to foundations,
walls, roofs, floors, ceilings, stairs, doors, windows, and electrical, mechanical, plumbing systems and
fixtures and equipment.

X:\Plandev\Witt\2018 Code Upgrade\Meeting 8\Final\IFC-2 - Proposed Revisions to Amendments Previously

Approved by the BBA (Redlined).docx
Page 2 of 12

Page 46 of 68



Attachment IFC-2
Fire Code — Proposed Revisions to
Amendments Previously Approved by the BBA (Redlined)

For purpose of determining hard cost, remodeling work does not include the following:

1. Interior or exterior non-structural demolition work or removal of existing improvements, fixtures,
or equipment.

2. Work to install a fire sprinkler system or increase the size of the water service to a building as
required to serve a fire sprinkler system.

3. Work to install a fire alarm and detection system.

4. Installation of interior floor, wall, and ceiling finishes such as paint, wallcoverings, paneling or tile
over wallboard, or carpet, wood, or tile flooring over a subfloor.

5. Cabinets and casework, countertops, shelving units, or door, window, base, and ceiling trim.

6. Furniture, appliances, decorative fixtures, window treatments or business sales, display or service
fixtures and equipment.

16. Amend Section 202 to add the definition of Hazard Categories and Classifications to read as follows:

HAZARD CATEGORIES AND CLASSIFICATIONS. The relative degree of hazard from fire between different
occupancy classifications. The Hazard Categories and Classifications shall be as set forth below.

Hazard Category Occupancy Classification
1 (highest hazard) Industrial or storage occupancies with high hazard contents
2 Health care, detention and correctional, residential board and care, food

service establishments with kitchen hood and duct systems and greater than
ten occupants

3 Assembly, educational, day care, ambulatory health care, residential,
mercantile, business, general and special-purpose industrial, ordinary hazard
storage

4 (lowest hazard) Industrial or storage occupancies with low hazard contents

17. Amend Section 202 to add the definition of Market Value to read as follows:

MARKET VALUE. The dollar value of a building or structure, excluding land value, calculated to be three
times the current assessed value established by the township assessor at 33.3% of the market value.

18. Amend Section 202 to delete the definition of Open Burning in its entirety and substitute the following:

OPEN BURNING. The burning of materials wherein products of combustion are emitted directly into the
ambient air without passing through a stack or chimney from an enclosed chamber. Open burning does
not include road flares, smudge pots and similar devices associated with safety or occupational uses
typically considered open flames, recreational fires or use of stationary outdoor fireplaces or portable
outdoor fireplaces. For the purpose of this definition, a chamber shall be regarded as enclosed when,
during the time combustion occurs, only apertures, ducts, stacks, flues, or chimneys necessary to
provide combustion air and permit the escape of exhaust gas are open.

19. Amend Section 202 to add the definition of Roof Area, Gross to read as follows:

ROOF AREA, GROSS. The square footage of the horizontal plane(s) formed at the outside top edge of
the perimeter walls of a building or structure.

20. Amend Section 202 to add the definition of Wall Area, Gross to read as follows:

X:\Plandev\Witt\2018 Code Upgrade\Meeting 8\Final\IFC-2 - Proposed Revisions to Amendments Previously
Approved by the BBA (Redlined).docx
Page 3 of 12

Page 47 of 68



Attachment IFC-2
Fire Code — Proposed Revisions to
Amendments Previously Approved by the BBA (Redlined)

21.

22.

23.

24.
25.
26.

WALL AREA, GROSS. The square footage of all outside wall surfaces from a point eight inches above the
adjacent grade to the soffit or eave of a building or structure.

Delete Section 304.3.4 in its entirety and substitute the following and retain all exceptions:

304.3.4 Capacity of 1 cubic yard or more. Dumpsters with an individual capacity of 1.0 cubic yard or
more shall not be stored in buildings or placed within 10 feet of combustible walls, building openings,
exterior stairways, combustible roof eave lines, telecommunication towers, utility drops, or utility
poles, unless the dumpsters are constructed of noncombustible materials and have a solid metal lid.

Revise the title of Section 307 to read as follows:

SECTION 307 OPEN BURNING, RECREATIONAL FIRES AND OUTDOOR FIREPLACES.
Delete Sections 307.1 and 307.1.1 in their entirety and substitute the following:

307.1 General. The regulations on open burning and fires are established in Title 7 Health And
Sanitation, Chapter 7 Air Pollution, in the Glen Ellyn Village Code.

Delete Sections 307.2 and 307.2.1 in their entirety.
Delete Section 307.3 in its entirety.
Delete Section 307.4 and all subsections in their entirety and substitute the following:

307.4 Location. The location for outdoor burning shall be as indicated in Sections 307.4.1 through
307.4.6.

307.4.1 Bonfires. Bonfires shall not be permitted unless approved by the Fire Code Official.

307.4.2 Recreational fires. Recreational fires shall not be permitted unless approved by the Fire
Code Official.

307.4.3 Portable outdoor fireplaces. Portable outdoor fireplaces, including fire pits, incinerators,
chimineas and similar devices shall be used in accordance with the manufacturer’s instructions and
shall not be operated within 15 feet of a building, structure, or combustible material.

307.4.4 Stationary outdoor fireplaces. The fire box opening of a stationary outdoor fireplace shall
not be located closer than 10 feet to a building, structure, or combustible material.

Exception: The fire box opening of a stationary outdoor fireplace used for cooking shall not be
located closer than 15 feet to a building, structure, or combustible material.

307.4.5 Stationary fire features. Manufactured stationary fire features, including fire pits, fire
bowls, fire columns, fire tables and similar devices shall be installed and used in accordance with
the manufacturer’s instructions and shall not be operated within 10 feet of a building, structure, or
combustible material. Fuel lines servicing such devices shall be provided with a shut-off valve at
the exterior face of the building and be subject to inspection, including a pressure test, prior to first
use.

307.4.6 Stationary fire pits. Stationary fire pits shall be constructed of non-combustible material.
The fire containment area of a stationary outdoor fire pit shall not be located closer than 15 feet to
a building, structure, or combustible material. Stationary fire pits shall have a containment area for

X:\Plandev\Witt\2018 Code Upgrade\Meeting 8\Final\IFC-2 - Proposed Revisions to Amendments Previously

Approved by the BBA (Redlined).docx
Page 4 of 12

Page 48 of 68



Attachment IFC-2
Fire Code — Proposed Revisions to
Amendments Previously Approved by the BBA (Redlined)

burning material with a total fuel area to exceed the equivalent of 3 feet in diameter and a total
fuel height not to exceed 2 feet.

27. Amend Section 307.5 to read as follows:

307.5 Attendance. The use of portable outdoor fireplaces shall be constantly attended by an adult until
the fire is extinguished. A minimum of one portable fire extinguisher complying with section 906 with a
minimum 4-A rating or other approved on-site fire-extinguishing equipment, such as dirt, sand, water
barrel, or garden hose, shall be available for immediate utilization.

28. Add new Section 307.6 to read as follows:

307.6 Material to be burned. Portable outdoor fireplaces, stationary fireplaces not used for cooking,
and stationary fire pits shall be limited to burning the following materials.

1. Seasoned firewood

2. Dimensional lumber (unpainted, unfinished, unlaminated or glued, and non-treated)
3. Manufactured logs

4. Manufactured non-wood logs specifically made for use in fireplaces.

No other material may be burned in outdoor fireplace. Burning of unseasoned wood, leaves, rubbish,
garbage, and other waste materials is prohibited.

29. Add new Section 307.7 to read as follows:
307.7 Spark arrestors. All outdoor fireplaces, stationary fireplaces not used for cooking, and stationary

fire pits shall have a cover, screen, or glass doors to prevent the distribution of hot embers or sparks
outside the firebox or containment area.

30. Delete Section 308.1.4 in its entirety and substitute the following:

308.1.4 Open-Flame Cooking Devices. Charcoal burners, LP-gas grills, and other open-flame cooking
devices shall not be operated on combustible balconies or decks or within 5 feet horizontally or 5 feet
vertically below combustible construction.

Exceptions:
1. Where buildings, balconies and decks are protected by an automatic sprinkler system.

2. LP gas cooking devices having LP-gas container with a water capacity not greater than 21/2
pounds [nominal 1 pound (0.454 kg) LP-gas capacity].

3. Where combustible surfaces are protected and covered with a non-combustible material
approved by the building official.

31. Delete Section 311.5.4 in its entirety and substitute the following:

311.5.4 Placard symbols. The design of the placards shall use the following symbols:

1. O This symbol shall mean that the structure had normal structural conditions at the time of
marking.

2. N This symbol shall mean that structural or interior hazards exist, and interior firefighting or
rescue operations should be conducted with extreme caution.

X:\Plandev\Witt\2018 Code Upgrade\Meeting 8\Final\IFC-2 - Proposed Revisions to Amendments Previously
Approved by the BBA (Redlined).docx
Page 5 of 12

Page 49 of 68



Attachment IFC-2
Fire Code — Proposed Revisions to
Amendments Previously Approved by the BBA (Redlined)

32.

33.

34.

35.

36.

3. X This symbol shall mean that structural or interior hazards exist to a degree that consideration
should be given to limit firefighting to exterior operations only, with entry only occurring for
known life hazards.

4. Vacant marker hazard identification symbols: The following symbols shall be used to designate
known hazards on the vacant building marker. They shall be placed directly above the symbol.

4.1. R/O—Roof open.
4.2. S/M—Stairs, steps and landing missing.
4.3. F/E—Avoid fire escapes.
4.4. H/F—Holes in floor.
Add a new Section 315.4.3 to read as follows:

315.4.3 Retail display. Retail display of combustible or flammable materials such as firewood,
landscape mulch, straw bales, propane tanks or similar products shall be limited to location and
quantity as approved by the Fire Code Official.

Add a new Section 320 to read as follows:
320 PROHIBITED OCCUPANCIES

320.1 Below grade occupancies. Residential dwelling units one story or more below the level of Fire
Department access in multi-family or mixed-use buildings within the C5 Zoning District shall be
prohibited.

Add new Section 505.1.1 to read as follows:

505.1.1 Building address. The rear entrance of all multi-tenant commercial buildings shall have street
address number in compliance with Section 505.1.

Add new Section 505.1.2 to read as follows:

505.1.2 Multiple doors. Doors located within the exterior perimeter walls of all commercial buildings
that are in addition to the main entrance or main rear entrance doors shall be identified with address
numbers or other designation approved by the Fire Code Official.

Delete Section 506.1 in its entirety and substitute the following:

506.1 Where required. All commercial and multi-family dwelling unit buildings shall have a key box
installed near the main entrance in a location approved by the Fire Code Official. The key box shall be of
an approved type listed in accordance with UL 1037.

1. The key box shall include keys to provide access to all tenant spaces in accordance with Section
506.1.3.

2. All tenant spaces with main doors within the exterior perimeter walls of all commercial
buildings shall have a separate key box.

3. All commercial buildings with multiple tenancies and an exterior door that accesses the fire
sprinkler room shall have a key box within 5 feet of the fire sprinkler room access door.

4. All existing tenancies shall provide a key box within one year of the date of adoption of this
Code.

X:\Plandev\Witt\2018 Code Upgrade\Meeting 8\Final\IFC-2 - Proposed Revisions to Amendments Previously

Approved by the BBA (Redlined).docx
Page 6 of 12

Page 50 of 68



Attachment IFC-2
Fire Code — Proposed Revisions to
Amendments Previously Approved by the BBA (Redlined)

37.

38.

39.

40.

41.
42.

Exception: A key box to contain keys to access individual dwelling units shall be provided in the
building’s electrical room.

Add new Section 506.1.3 to read as follows:

506.1.3 Keys required. The key box shall contain the following types of keys. Keys shall be clearly and
individually marked or tagged to indicate which door it operates. Keys or codes to access security
systems shall not be provided.

1. Keys necessary to access exterior and interior doors and provide entry to all spaces.

2. Two sets of keys to access the main entry door.

3. In multi-family dwelling unit buildings, provide one set of building keys for each floor or
rooftop level.

4. Keys for fire alarm pull stations, panels, and fire protection systems.

5. Keys for elevators and electrical equipment.

6. Keys to override any electronic pads that control access through any door.

7. Keys to provide access to individual dwelling units.

8. Other keys as determined required by the Fire Code Official based on building use or

occupancy.
Add new Section 506.1.4 to read as follows:

506.1.4 Key box capacity. Key boxes shall be of sufficient size to accommodate the required keys. In
buildings containing 1-3 occupancies, the key box shall have a minimum capacity of 10 keys. In buildings
containing 4-10 occupancies, the key box shall have a minimum capacity of 25 keys. In buildings
containing 11 or more occupancies, the key box shall have a minimum capacity of 50 keys.

Amend Section 903.2 to read as follows and retain the Exception:

903.2 Where Required. Approved automatic sprinkler systems in new buildings and structures in use
group A, B, E, M, R, F, H, l and S and in one- and two-family dwellings and townhouses shall be provided
throughout the building or structure and in the locations described in Sections 903.2.11 and 903.2.12.

Delete Section 903.2.1 in its entirety and substitute the following:

903.2.1 Change of use. An automatic sprinkler system shall be installed in existing buildings and
structures, or portions thereof, as if the building or portions thereof subject to the change of use were
of new construction, where any of the following occurs.

1. Where a change of use does not result in the change of occupancy classification but results in
the creation of a hazardous contents area.

2. Where the change of use results in an occupancy classification of a higher hazard classification
category (i.e., a lower hazard classification number), as defined in Section 202 HAZARD
CATEGORIES AND CLASSIFICATIONS.

3. Inuse group A or E when the occupied space(s) are located below the level of Fire Department
access.

Delete Sections 903.2.1.1 through 903.2.10.1 in their entirety.

Amend Section 903.3.1.1 to read as follows:

X:\Plandev\Witt\2018 Code Upgrade\Meeting 8\Final\IFC-2 - Proposed Revisions to Amendments Previously

Approved by the BBA (Redlined).docx
Page 7 of 12

Page 51 of 68



Attachment IFC-2
Fire Code — Proposed Revisions to
Amendments Previously Approved by the BBA (Redlined)

43.

44,

45.

46.

47.

48.

903.3.1.1 NFPA 13 sprinkler systems. Where the provisions of this code require that a building or
portion thereof be equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system in accordance with this
section, sprinklers shall be installed throughout in accordance with NFPA 13 except as provided in
Sections 903.3.1.1.1 and 903.3.1.1.2. The sprinkler system shall be designed with a minimum 5 psi
cushion at the furthest sprinkler head.

Amend Section 903.3.1.2 to read as follows:

903.3.1.2 NFPA 13R sprinkler systems. Automatic sprinkler systems in Group R occupancies up to and
including four stories in height in buildings not exceeding 60 feet (18 288 mm) in height above grade
plane shall be permitted to be installed throughout in accordance with NFPA 13R.

The number of stories of Group R occupancies constructed in accordance with Sections 510.2 and 510.4
of the International Building Code shall be measured from the horizontal assembly creating separate
buildings. The sprinkler system shall be designed with a minimum 5 psi cushion at the furthest sprinkler
head.

Amend Section 903.3.1.3 to read as follows:

903.3.1.3 NFPA 13D sprinkler systems. Automatic sprinkler systems installed in one- and two-family
dwellings; Group R-3; Group R-4, Condition 1; and townhouses

shall be permitted to be installed throughout in accordance with NFPA 13D. The sprinkler system shall
be designed with a minimum 5 psi cushion at the furthest sprinkler head.

Amend Section 903.4.2 to read as follows:

903.4.2 Alarms. An approved audible/visual device with a blue lens, located on the exterior of the building
in an approved location on the closest exterior fagade facing and parallel to the street, shall be connected
to each automatic sprinkler system. Such sprinkler waterflow alarm devices shall be activated by water
flow equivalent to the flow of a single sprinkler of the smallest orifice size installed in the system. Where
a fire alarm system is installed, actuation of the automatic sprinkler system shall actuate the building fire
alarm system. Existing exterior alarm bells shall be replaced with an approved audible/visible device
within one year of the date of adoption of this Code.

Amend Section 903.4.2.1 to read as follows:

903.4.2.1 Alarms in Dwelling Units. In one- and two-family dwellings, multi-family dwelling units in
buildings without common interior paths of egress, and townhouses a six-inch water flow bell shall be
installed on the interior return air plenum of the forced air furnace, or other approved location, to serve
every living space and a horn/strobe notification device shall be installed on the exterior front of the
building in an approved location visible from the street.

Amend Section 905.3.1 to read as follows and retain all exceptions:

905.3.1 Height. Class | standpipe systems shall be installed throughout buildings where the floor level of
the highest story is located more than 30 feet (9144 mm), or two stories, above the lowest level of Fire
Department access, or where the floor level of the lowest story is located more than 30 feet (9144 mm),
or two stories, below the highest level of Fire Department vehicle access or where any portion of the
floor area is more than 200 feet (61 m) of travel distance from the nearest point of Fire Department
vehicle access.

Delete Section 907.2.7 exception 2 in its entirety and substitute the following:

X:\Plandev\Witt\2018 Code Upgrade\Meeting 8\Final\IFC-2 - Proposed Revisions to Amendments Previously

Approved by the BBA (Redlined).docx
Page 8 of 12

Page 52 of 68



Attachment IFC-2
Fire Code — Proposed Revisions to
Amendments Previously Approved by the BBA (Redlined)

49.

50.

51.

52.

53.

54.

55.

56.
57.

2. Manual fire alarm boxes are not required at the public entrance where the building is equipped
throughout with an automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 and
the occupant notification appliances will automatically activate throughout the notification zones
upon sprinkler water flow.

Delete Section 907.2.10 in its entirety and substitute the following:

907.2.10 Single- and multiple-station smoke alarms. Listed single- and multiple-station smoke alarms
complying with UL 217 shall be installed in accordance with Sections 907.2.10.1 through 907.2.10.8,
NFPA 72, and (425 ILCS 60/) Smoke Detector Act.

Amend Section 907.2.10.1 to add the following:

4. Within 15 feet of every room used for sleeping purposes. The detector shall be installed on the
ceiling and at least 6 inches from any wall, or on a wall located between 4 and 6 inches from the
ceiling.

Delete condition number 1 under Section 907.2.10.2 in its entirety and replace with the following:

1. Within 15 feet of every room used for sleeping purposes. The detector shall be installed on the
ceiling and at least 6 inches from any wall, or on a wall located between 4 and 6 inches from the
ceiling.

Add a new Section 907.2.10.8 to read as follows:

907.2.10.8 Structures with more than one dwelling unit and mixed-use structures. Every structure which
(1) contains more than one dwelling unit, or (2) contains at least one dwelling unit and is a mixed-use
structure, shall contain at least one approved smoke detector at the uppermost ceiling of each interior
stairwell. The detector shall be installed on the ceiling, at least 6 inches from the wall, or on a wall
located between 4 and 6 inches from the ceiling.

Add a new Section 907.2.24 to read as follows:

907.2.24 C5 Zoning District: An automatic fire alarm and detection system shall be installed in all new
buildings and structures in the C5 Zoning District. By the end of the first full calendar year after the date
of adoption of this code, an automatic fire alarm and detection system shall be installed in all existing
buildings within the C5 Zoning District in accordance with NFPA 72.

Delete Section 907.4.3 in its entirety and substitute the following:

907.4.3 Automatic Smoke Detection. Where an automatic smoke detection system is required, it shall
utilize smoke detectors unless ambient conditions prohibit such an installation. In spaces where smoke
detectors cannot be utilized due to ambient conditions and in common corridors and rooms exceeding
100 square feet, approved automatic heat detectors shall be required.

Add Section 907.5.2.3.3 to read as follows:

907.5.2.3.3 Exterior visible alarms. An approved audible/visual device with a clear lens (white light),
located on the exterior of the building in an approved location on the closest exterior facade facing and
parallel to the street, shall be connected to each fire alarm and detection system in new installations.
An exterior audible/visible device shall be installed on existing buildings equipped with a fire alarm and
detection system within one year of the date of adoption of this Code.

Delete Section 907.5.3 in its entirety.

Renumber Section 907.7.5.2 to Section 907.6.6.3 and amend to read as follows:

X:\Plandev\Witt\2018 Code Upgrade\Meeting 8\Final\IFC-2 - Proposed Revisions to Amendments Previously

Approved by the BBA (Redlined).docx
Page 9 of 12

Page 53 of 68



Attachment IFC-2
Fire Code — Proposed Revisions to
Amendments Previously Approved by the BBA (Redlined)

907.6.6.3 Monitoring station. All fire alarm systems shall report to an approved third-party monitoring
station.

Exception: In buildings serving occupancy group A or group E the fire alarm system shall be directly
connected to the DuPage Public Safety Communications (DU-COMM) facility (remote station) in
accordance with NFPA.

58. Delete Section 1103.5 in its entirety and substitute the following:

1103.5 Sprinkler Systems. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided in existing buildings in
accordance with Sections 1103.5.1 through 1103.5.5.

59. Renumber Section 4603.4.3 to Section 1103.5.5 and amend to read as follows:
1103.5.5 Additions To Existing Buildings And Structures.

1. In buildings of use group A, B, E, M, R, F, H, |, or S, an approved automatic sprinkler system shall
be provided throughout the addition if the gross floor area of the addition exceeds 2,500 square
feet, or throughout the addition and the existing building if the combined gross floor area of the
addition and the existing building exceeds 5,000 square feet.

2. In buildings of use group A, B, E, M, R, F, H, |, or S, and in one- and two-family dwellings and
townhouses, an approved automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout the addition
and throughout the existing building or if the gross floor area of the addition exceeds 150% of the
gross floor area of the existing building.

3. In existing buildings and structures where the modification factor as determined in Section
1103.5.9 is equal to or greater than exeeeds-1.252-0.

60. Renumber Section 4603.4.4 to Section 1103.5.6 and amend to read as follows:
1103.5.6 Alterations To Existing Buildings And Structures.

1. In buildings of use group A, B, E, M, R, F, H, |, or S, an approved automatic sprinkler system shall
be provided throughout the existing building and any addition if the structurally altered existing
exterior wall and roof gross square foot area exceeds 50% of the total existing exterior wall and
roof gross square foot area.

2. In one- and two-family dwellings and townhouses, an approved automatic sprinkler system shall
be provided throughout the existing building and any addition if the structurally altered existing
exterior wall and roof gross square foot area exceeds 75% of the total existing exterior wall and
roof gross square foot area.

3. In existing buildings and structures where the modification factor as determined in Section
1103.5.9 is equal to or greater than exeeeds-1.252-0.

61. Renumber Section 4603.4.5 to Section 1103.5.7 and amend to read as follows:
1103.5.7 Remodeling In Existing Buildings and Structures.

1. In buildings of all occupancy groups, except group U and one- and two-family dwellings and
townhouses, an approved automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout the
remodeled interior area if the hard cost of all remodeling work exceeds $1,000,000 or 25% of the
market value of the building or structure.

X:\Plandev\Witt\2018 Code Upgrade\Meeting 8\Final\IFC-2 - Proposed Revisions to Amendments Previously
Approved by the BBA (Redlined).docx
Page 10 of 12

Page 54 of 68



Attachment IFC-2
Fire Code — Proposed Revisions to
Amendments Previously Approved by the BBA (Redlined)

62.

63.

64.

65.

2. In one and two family dwellings and townhouses, an approved automatic sprinkler system shall
be provided throughout the remodeled interior area of the existing building if the hard cost of all
remodeling work exceeds $300,000.

3. In existing buildings and structures where the modification factor as determined in Section
1103.5.9 is equal to or greater than exceeds-1.252.0.

Add a new Section 1103.5.8 to read as follows:

1103.5.8 Cumulative effect of modifications. When calculating the gross floor area, exterior wall areas,
and gross roof area under Sections 1103.5.5 and 1103.5.6, and the hard cost under Section 1103.5.7,
the calculated values shall include all work to be performed on the existing building or structure under
consideration as part of the permit application, plus all work performed on the existing building or
structure within the two-year period of time immediately prior to the date of the current permit
application.

Add a new Section 1103.5.9 to read as follows:

1103.5.9 Building and structures modification factor. In addition to the requirements set forth in
Sections, 1103.5.5, 1103.5.6 and 1103.5.7. an approved automatic sprinkler system shall be installed
throughout existing buildings and structures where the modification factor M, determined in
accordance with the following, is equal to or greater than 1.252-8.

M = modification factor where,

Aaddition = gross square foot floor area of addition

Aatteration = gross square foot area of structurally altered exterior walls and roof
Sadditionremodeting = actual-hard cost of additioninteriorremedelingwerk

Efioor = gross floor area of existing building or structure

Esurface = gross area of existing exterior walls and roof

Sthreshold = +esser-of£-$300,000-0F25%-of the-marketvalue-of the building-orstructure

M = Aaddition / Efloor + Aalteration / Esurface + $additiom=emed-ehﬂg / $threshold

The hard cost of the addition is established as 0.85 times the square foot area of all habitable levels of
the addition times the most current building valuation cost for single-family homes of Type VA
construction as published by the International Code Council.

Exception: Single-family dwellings less than 1,500 square feet in gross floor area shall not be subject to
the modification factor.

Add a new Section 1103.5.10 to read as follows:

1103.5.10 Residential basement remodeling. When the hard cost of basement remodeling in one- and
two-family dwellings and townhouses exceeds $15,000, a sprinkler head shall be installed on the
domestic water line within 5 feet of any boiler, furnace or clothes dryer.

Renumber Section 4603.5 to Section 1103.6 and amend to read as follows:

1103.6 Standpipes. Class | Standpipes shall be provided in all existing buildings and structures in use
group A, B, E, M, R, F, H, | or S and installed in accordance with section 905 where any one of the
following conditions exist:

X:\Plandev\Witt\2018 Code Upgrade\Meeting 8\Final\IFC-2 - Proposed Revisions to Amendments Previously

Approved by the BBA (Redlined).docx
Page 11 of 12

Page 55 of 68



Attachment IFC-2
Fire Code — Proposed Revisions to
Amendments Previously Approved by the BBA (Redlined)

66.
67.

68.

69.

1.  The existing building is enlarged to exceed two stories or where any portion of the floor area
exceeds two hundred feet (200') from the nearest Fire Department access.

2.  The existing building is enlarged and the gross floor area of the addition exceeds 150% of the
gross floor area of the existing building or structure.

3.  The existing building is altered and the structurally altered exterior wall and roof gross area
exceeds 75% of the existing total exterior wall and roof gross area.

4.  The existing building is remodeled and the hard cost of the remodeled area exceeds $1,000,000
or 25% of the market value of the building or structure.

Exception: Standpipes shall not be required in one- and two-family dwellings and townhouses.
Delete Sections 1103.6.1, and 1103.6.2 in their entirety.
Renumber Section 4603.6 to Section 1103.7 and amend to read as follows:

1103.7 Fire Alarm Systems. An approved fire alarm system shall be installed in existing buildings and
structures in accordance with Sections 1103.7.1 through 1103.7.6 and provide occupant notification in
accordance with section 907.6 unless other requirements are provided by other sections of this Code.

Exception: Occupancies with an existing, previously approved fire alarm system.
Amend Section 1103.7.6 to read as follows and maintain the Exceptions:

1103.7.6 Group R-2. A manual fire alarm system that activates the occupant notification system in
accordance with Section 907.5 shall be installed in existing R-2 occupancies more than three stories in
height or with more than 12 dwelling or sleeping units. The detection device shall be a heat detector
which shall be installed in the main living room. Smoke detectors or other alarm or detection devices
installed within the dwelling or sleeping unit shall not be tied into the building’s occupant notification
system.

Add Section 1103.7.7 to read as follows:

1103.7.7 Group A, B, E, M, R, F, H, | And S. An approved fire alarm system installed in accordance with
the provisions of this Code and NFPA 72 shall be provided under any one of the following conditions:

1.  The existing building is enlarged or the gross floor area is increased and the hard cost of the
construction work exceeds $15,000.

2. The existing building is altered and the hard cost of the construction work to structurally alter the
exterior wall and roof exceeds $15,000.

3.  The existing building is remodeled and the hard cost of the interior construction work exceeds
$15,000.

Exception: Fire alarm systems shall not be required in one- and two-family dwellings and townhouses.

(Ord. 5893, 10-25-2010, eff. 12-1-2010; Ord. 5918, 1-24-2011; Ord. 6603, 5-29-2018)

X:\Plandev\Witt\2018 Code Upgrade\Meeting 8\Final\IFC-2 - Proposed Revisions to Amendments Previously

Approved by the BBA (Redlined).docx
Page 12 of 12

Page 56 of 68



Attachment IFC-3
Fire Code — Proposed Revisions to
Amendments Previously Approved by the BBA (Clean)

5-2-1. Adoption of the Fire Code.

(A)  The 2018 ICC International Fire Code is adopted by reference as the standards and regulations for governing
the safeguarding of life and property from fire and explosion hazards arising from the storage, handling and
use of hazardous substances, materials and devices, and from conditions hazardous to life and property in
the occupancy of buildings and premises as this Code is intended, recommended, maintained and published
by the International Code Council except such portions thereof that are deleted, modified, or amended in
this chapter. At least one copy of the 2018 ICC International Fire Code shall be maintained on file in the
office of the Village Clerk for inspection and copying as a public record.

(B)  The provisions of the 2018 ICC International Fire Code are hereby deleted, modified, and amended as
follows:

1. Delete Section 101.1 in its entirety and substitute the following:

101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the fire code of the Village of Glen Ellyn hereinafter
referred to as "this Code".

2.  Amend Section 102.5 to add the following:

3. Fire protection systems and equipment provisions: All such provisions shall apply where specifically
prescribed in this Code for one- and two-family dwellings and townhouses.

3. Amend Section 102.7 to add the following at the end of the paragraph:

Exception: Wherever reference to the International Plumbing Code is made, substitute the Plumbing
Code, Department of Public Health, State of lllinois.

4. Amends Section 103 heading to read as follows:
SECTION 103 FIRE DEPARTMENT
5. Delete Section 103.1 in its entirety and substitute the following:

103.1 General. The Fire Department is established within the jurisdiction under the direction of the Fire
C-code Official. The function of the Fire Department shall be the implementation, administration, and
enforcement of the provisions of this Code in accordance with Title 5 Fire Regulations, Chapter 1 Fire
Department, in the Glen Ellyn Village Code.

6. Delete Sections 104.10 and 104.10.1 in their entirety and substitute the following:

104.10 Fire Investigations. The Fire Code Official shall investigate, or cause to be investigated, every fire
or explosion occurring within his jurisdiction that is of a suspicious nature, or which involves the loss of
life or serious injury or causes destruction or damage to property. Such investigation shall be initiated
immediately upon the occurrence of such fire or explosion; and if it appears that such an occurrence is
of a suspicious nature, the Fire Code Official shall immediately take charge of the physical evidence and,
in order to preserve physical evidence relating to the cause or origin of such fire or explosion, the Fire
Official shall take means to prevent access by any person to the structure or premises until such
evidence has been properly processed. The Fire Code Official shall notify those persons designated by
law to pursue investigations into such matters and shall further cooperate with the authorities in
collection of evidence and prosecution of the case and shall pursue the investigation to its conclusion.

X:\Plandev\Witt\2018 Code Upgrade\Meeting 8\Final\IFC-3 - Proposed Revisions to Amendments Previously
Approved by the BBA (Clean).docx
Page 1 of 12

Page 57 of 68



Attachment IFC-3
Fire Code — Proposed Revisions to
Amendments Previously Approved by the BBA (Clean)

7.

10.

11.

12.

13.

14.

15.

Add a new Section 104.12 to read as follows:

104.12 Fire Prevention Inspections. The Fire Code Official shall inspect all existing structures and
premises, except single-family dwellings, two-family dwellings, and individual dwelling units within
multi-family buildings, for the purpose of ascertaining and causing to be corrected any conditions liable
to cause fire, contribute to the spread of fire, interfere with fire-fighting operations, or endanger life or
any violation of the provisions or intent of this Code or any other ordinance affecting fire safety.

Renumber Section 108.1 to Section 109.1 as follows:

109.1 Board Of Appeals Established. The structure, responsibilities and procedures of the Building Board
of Appeals is established in Title 2 Boards and Commissions, Chapter 7 Building Board of Appeals, in the
Glen Ellyn Village Code.

Renumber Section 108.3 to Section 109.3 as follows: in its entirety and substitute the following:

109.3 Qualifications. The board of appeals shall consist of members who are qualified by experience
and training to pass on matters pertaining to hazards of fire, explosion, hazardous conditions, or fire
protection systems.

Renumber Section 109.3 to Section 110.4 as follows:

110.4 Violation Penalties. Any person who violates a provision of this Code shall, upon conviction
thereof, be subject to a fine of not less than $50.00 nor more than $750.00 unless a fine for the
violation of this Code is listed in the Village Code of Glen Ellyn, lllinois, then the more stringent shall
apply. Each day that a violation continues after due notice has been served shall be deemed a separate
offense.

Renumber Section 111.4 to Section 112.4 as follows:

112.4 Failure to Comply. Any person who shall continue any work after having been served with a stop
work order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe
condition, shall be liable to a fine of not less than $50.00 dollars or more than $750.00 dollars. Each day
that a violation continues after due notice has been served shall be deemed a separate offense.

Amend Section 202 to add the following use under Business Group B:
Co-working Facility
Amend Section 202 to add the definition of Co-working Facility to read as follows:

CO-WORKING FACILITY. A facility having more than (10) persons on site at any time, and in which food
and/or drink consumption occurs as part of the stated business plan before, during or after normal
business hours shall be classified as a Group A-2 occupancy.

Amend Section 202 to replace the definition of the Fire Code Official with the following:

Fire Code Official. The Fire Chief, the Building and Zoning Official or other designated authority charged
with the administration and enforcement of the Code, or a duly authorized representative, under the
direction and with the approval of the Director of Community Development or the Village Manager.

Amend Section 202 to add the definition of Hard Cost to read as follows:

HARD COST. The cost of all labor, materials, overhead and profit to complete remodeling of an existing
building. Remodeling work includes, but is not limited to, improvements and alterations to foundations,
walls, roofs, floors, ceilings, stairs, doors, windows, and electrical, mechanical, plumbing systems and
fixtures and equipment.

X:\Plandev\Witt\2018 Code Upgrade\Meeting 8\Final\IFC-3 - Proposed Revisions to Amendments Previously

Approved by the BBA (Clean).docx
Page 2 of 12

Page 58 of 68



Attachment IFC-3
Fire Code — Proposed Revisions to
Amendments Previously Approved by the BBA (Clean)

For purpose of determining hard cost, remodeling work does not include the following:

1. Interior or exterior non-structural demolition work or removal of existing improvements, fixtures,
or equipment.

2. Work to install a fire sprinkler system or increase the size of the water service to a building as
required to serve a fire sprinkler system.

3. Work to install a fire alarm and detection system.

4. Installation of interior floor, wall, and ceiling finishes such as paint, wallcoverings, paneling or tile
over wallboard, or carpet, wood, or tile flooring over a subfloor.

5. Cabinets and casework, countertops, shelving units, or door, window, base, and ceiling trim.

6. Furniture, appliances, decorative fixtures, window treatments or business sales, display or service
fixtures and equipment.

16. Amend Section 202 to add the definition of Hazard Categories and Classifications to read as follows:

HAZARD CATEGORIES AND CLASSIFICATIONS. The relative degree of hazard from fire between different
occupancy classifications. The Hazard Categories and Classifications shall be as set forth below.

Hazard Category Occupancy Classification
1 (highest hazard) Industrial or storage occupancies with high hazard contents
2 Health care, detention and correctional, residential board and care, food

service establishments with kitchen hood and duct systems and greater than
ten occupants

3 Assembly, educational, day care, ambulatory health care, residential,
mercantile, business, general and special-purpose industrial, ordinary hazard
storage

4 (lowest hazard) Industrial or storage occupancies with low hazard contents

17. Amend Section 202 to add the definition of Market Value to read as follows:

MARKET VALUE. The dollar value of a building or structure, excluding land value, calculated to be three
times the current assessed value established by the township assessor at 33.3% of the market value.

18. Amend Section 202 to delete the definition of Open Burning in its entirety and substitute the following:

OPEN BURNING. The burning of materials wherein products of combustion are emitted directly into the
ambient air without passing through a stack or chimney from an enclosed chamber. Open burning does
not include road flares, smudge pots and similar devices associated with safety or occupational uses
typically considered open flames, recreational fires or use of stationary outdoor fireplaces or portable
outdoor fireplaces. For the purpose of this definition, a chamber shall be regarded as enclosed when,
during the time combustion occurs, only apertures, ducts, stacks, flues, or chimneys necessary to
provide combustion air and permit the escape of exhaust gas are open.

19. Amend Section 202 to add the definition of Roof Area, Gross to read as follows:

ROOF AREA, GROSS. The square footage of the horizontal plane(s) formed at the outside top edge of
the perimeter walls of a building or structure.

20. Amend Section 202 to add the definition of Wall Area, Gross to read as follows:

X:\Plandev\Witt\2018 Code Upgrade\Meeting 8\Final\IFC-3 - Proposed Revisions to Amendments Previously
Approved by the BBA (Clean).docx
Page 3 of 12

Page 59 of 68



Attachment IFC-3
Fire Code — Proposed Revisions to
Amendments Previously Approved by the BBA (Clean)

21.

22.

23.

24.
25.
26.

WALL AREA, GROSS. The square footage of all outside wall surfaces from a point eight inches above the
adjacent grade to the soffit or eave of a building or structure.

Delete Section 304.3.4 in its entirety and substitute the following and retain all exceptions:

304.3.4 Capacity of 1 cubic yard or more. Dumpsters with an individual capacity of 1.0 cubic yard or
more shall not be stored in buildings or placed within 10 feet of combustible walls, building openings,
exterior stairways, combustible roof eave lines, telecommunication towers, utility drops, or utility
poles, unless the dumpsters are constructed of noncombustible materials and have a solid metal lid.

Revise the title of Section 307 to read as follows:

SECTION 307 OPEN BURNING, RECREATIONAL FIRES AND OUTDOOR FIREPLACES.
Delete Sections 307.1 and 307.1.1 in their entirety and substitute the following:

307.1 General. The regulations on open burning and fires are established in Title 7 Health And
Sanitation, Chapter 7 Air Pollution, in the Glen Ellyn Village Code.

Delete Sections 307.2 and 307.2.1 in their entirety.
Delete Section 307.3 in its entirety.
Delete Section 307.4 and all subsections in their entirety and substitute the following:

307.4 Location. The location for outdoor burning shall be as indicated in Sections 307.4.1 through
307.4.6.

307.4.1 Bonfires. Bonfires shall not be permitted unless approved by the Fire Code Official.

307.4.2 Recreational fires. Recreational fires shall not be permitted unless approved by the Fire
Code Official.

307.4.3 Portable outdoor fireplaces. Portable outdoor fireplaces, including fire pits, incinerators,
chimineas and similar devices shall be used in accordance with the manufacturer’s instructions and
shall not be operated within 15 feet of a building, structure, or combustible material.

307.4.4 Stationary outdoor fireplaces. The fire box opening of a stationary outdoor fireplace shall
not be located closer than 10 feet to a building, structure, or combustible material.

Exception: The fire box opening of a stationary outdoor fireplace used for cooking shall not be
located closer than 15 feet to a building, structure, or combustible material.

307.4.5 Stationary fire features. Manufactured stationary fire features, including fire pits, fire
bowls, fire columns, fire tables and similar devices shall be installed and used in accordance with
the manufacturer’s instructions and shall not be operated within 10 feet of a building, structure, or
combustible material. Fuel lines servicing such devices shall be provided with a shut-off valve at
the exterior face of the building and be subject to inspection, including a pressure test, prior to first
use.

307.4.6 Stationary fire pits. Stationary fire pits shall be constructed of non-combustible material.
The fire containment area of a stationary outdoor fire pit shall not be located closer than 15 feet to
a building, structure, or combustible material. Stationary fire pits shall have a containment area for

X:\Plandev\Witt\2018 Code Upgrade\Meeting 8\Final\IFC-3 - Proposed Revisions to Amendments Previously

Approved by the BBA (Clean).docx
Page 4 of 12

Page 60 of 68



Attachment IFC-3
Fire Code — Proposed Revisions to
Amendments Previously Approved by the BBA (Clean)

burning material with a total fuel area to exceed the equivalent of 3 feet in diameter and a total
fuel height not to exceed 2 feet.

27. Amend Section 307.5 to read as follows:

307.5 Attendance. The use of portable outdoor fireplaces shall be constantly attended by an adult until
the fire is extinguished. A minimum of one portable fire extinguisher complying with section 906 with a
minimum 4-A rating or other approved on-site fire-extinguishing equipment, such as dirt, sand, water
barrel, or garden hose, shall be available for immediate utilization.

28. Add new Section 307.6 to read as follows:

307.6 Material to be burned. Portable outdoor fireplaces, stationary fireplaces not used for cooking,
and stationary fire pits shall be limited to burning the following materials.

1. Seasoned firewood

2. Dimensional lumber (unpainted, unfinished, unlaminated or glued, and non-treated)
3. Manufactured logs

4. Manufactured non-wood logs specifically made for use in fireplaces.

No other material may be burned in outdoor fireplace. Burning of unseasoned wood, leaves, rubbish,
garbage, and other waste materials is prohibited.

29. Add new Section 307.7 to read as follows:
307.7 Spark arrestors. All outdoor fireplaces, stationary fireplaces not used for cooking, and stationary

fire pits shall have a cover, screen, or glass doors to prevent the distribution of hot embers or sparks
outside the firebox or containment area.

30. Delete Section 308.1.4 in its entirety and substitute the following:

308.1.4 Open-Flame Cooking Devices. Charcoal burners, LP-gas grills, and other open-flame cooking
devices shall not be operated on combustible balconies or decks or within 5 feet horizontally or 5 feet
vertically below combustible construction.

Exceptions:
1. Where buildings, balconies and decks are protected by an automatic sprinkler system.

2. LP gas cooking devices having LP-gas container with a water capacity not greater than 21/2
pounds [nominal 1 pound (0.454 kg) LP-gas capacity].

3. Where combustible surfaces are protected and covered with a non-combustible material
approved by the building official.

31. Delete Section 311.5.4 in its entirety and substitute the following:

311.5.4 Placard symbols. The design of the placards shall use the following symbols:

1. O This symbol shall mean that the structure had normal structural conditions at the time of
marking.

2. N This symbol shall mean that structural or interior hazards exist, and interior firefighting or
rescue operations should be conducted with extreme caution.

X:\Plandev\Witt\2018 Code Upgrade\Meeting 8\Final\IFC-3 - Proposed Revisions to Amendments Previously
Approved by the BBA (Clean).docx
Page 5 of 12

Page 61 of 68



Attachment IFC-3
Fire Code — Proposed Revisions to
Amendments Previously Approved by the BBA (Clean)

32.

33.

34.

35.

36.

3. X This symbol shall mean that structural or interior hazards exist to a degree that consideration
should be given to limit firefighting to exterior operations only, with entry only occurring for
known life hazards.

4. Vacant marker hazard identification symbols: The following symbols shall be used to designate
known hazards on the vacant building marker. They shall be placed directly above the symbol.

4.1. R/O—Roof open.
4.2. S/M—Stairs, steps and landing missing.
4.3. F/E—Avoid fire escapes.
4.4. H/F—Holes in floor.
Add a new Section 315.4.3 to read as follows:

315.4.3 Retail display. Retail display of combustible or flammable materials such as firewood,
landscape mulch, straw bales, propane tanks or similar products shall be limited to location and
quantity as approved by the Fire Code Official.

Add a new Section 320 to read as follows:
320 PROHIBITED OCCUPANCIES

320.1 Below grade occupancies. Residential dwelling units one story or more below the level of Fire
Department access in multi-family or mixed-use buildings within the C5 Zoning District shall be
prohibited.

Add new Section 505.1.1 to read as follows:

505.1.1 Building address. The rear entrance of all multi-tenant commercial buildings shall have street
address number in compliance with Section 505.1.

Add new Section 505.1.2 to read as follows:

505.1.2 Multiple doors. Doors located within the exterior perimeter walls of all commercial buildings
that are in addition to the main entrance or main rear entrance doors shall be identified with address
numbers or other designation approved by the Fire Code Official.

Delete Section 506.1 in its entirety and substitute the following:

506.1 Where required. All commercial and multi-family dwelling unit buildings shall have a key box
installed near the main entrance in a location approved by the Fire Code Official. The key box shall be of
an approved type listed in accordance with UL 1037.

1. The key box shall include keys to provide access to all tenant spaces in accordance with Section
506.1.3.

2. All tenant spaces with main doors within the exterior perimeter walls of all commercial
buildings shall have a separate key box.

3. All commercial buildings with multiple tenancies and an exterior door that accesses the fire
sprinkler room shall have a key box within 5 feet of the fire sprinkler room access door.

4. All existing tenancies shall provide a key box within one year of the date of adoption of this
Code.

X:\Plandev\Witt\2018 Code Upgrade\Meeting 8\Final\IFC-3 - Proposed Revisions to Amendments Previously

Approved by the BBA (Clean).docx
Page 6 of 12

Page 62 of 68



Attachment IFC-3
Fire Code — Proposed Revisions to
Amendments Previously Approved by the BBA (Clean)

37.

38.

39.

40.

41.
42.

Exception: A key box to contain keys to access individual dwelling units shall be provided in the
building’s electrical room.

Add new Section 506.1.3 to read as follows:

506.1.3 Keys required. The key box shall contain the following types of keys. Keys shall be clearly and
individually marked or tagged to indicate which door it operates. Keys or codes to access security
systems shall not be provided.

1. Keys necessary to access exterior and interior doors and provide entry to all spaces.

2. Two sets of keys to access the main entry door.

3. In multi-family dwelling unit buildings, provide one set of building keys for each floor or
rooftop level.

4. Keys for fire alarm pull stations, panels, and fire protection systems.

5. Keys for elevators and electrical equipment.

6. Keys to override any electronic pads that control access through any door.

7. Keys to provide access to individual dwelling units.

8. Other keys as determined required by the Fire Code Official based on building use or

occupancy.
Add new Section 506.1.4 to read as follows:

506.1.4 Key box capacity. Key boxes shall be of sufficient size to accommodate the required keys. In
buildings containing 1-3 occupancies, the key box shall have a minimum capacity of 10 keys. In buildings
containing 4-10 occupancies, the key box shall have a minimum capacity of 25 keys. In buildings
containing 11 or more occupancies, the key box shall have a minimum capacity of 50 keys.

Amend Section 903.2 to read as follows and retain the Exception:

903.2 Where Required. Approved automatic sprinkler systems in new buildings and structures in use
group A, B, E, M, R, F, H, l and S and in one- and two-family dwellings and townhouses shall be provided
throughout the building or structure and in the locations described in Sections 903.2.11 and 903.2.12.

Delete Section 903.2.1 in its entirety and substitute the following:

903.2.1 Change of use. An automatic sprinkler system shall be installed in existing buildings and
structures, or portions thereof, as if the building or portions thereof subject to the change of use were
of new construction, where any of the following occurs.

1. Where a change of use does not result in the change of occupancy classification but results in
the creation of a hazardous contents area.

2. Where the change of use results in an occupancy classification of a higher hazard classification
category (i.e., a lower hazard classification number), as defined in Section 202 HAZARD
CATEGORIES AND CLASSIFICATIONS.

3. Inuse group A or E when the occupied space(s) are located below the level of Fire Department
access.

Delete Sections 903.2.1.1 through 903.2.10.1 in their entirety.

Amend Section 903.3.1.1 to read as follows:

X:\Plandev\Witt\2018 Code Upgrade\Meeting 8\Final\IFC-3 - Proposed Revisions to Amendments Previously

Approved by the BBA (Clean).docx
Page 7 of 12

Page 63 of 68



Attachment IFC-3
Fire Code — Proposed Revisions to
Amendments Previously Approved by the BBA (Clean)

43.

44,

45.

46.

47.

48.

903.3.1.1 NFPA 13 sprinkler systems. Where the provisions of this code require that a building or
portion thereof be equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system in accordance with this
section, sprinklers shall be installed throughout in accordance with NFPA 13 except as provided in
Sections 903.3.1.1.1 and 903.3.1.1.2. The sprinkler system shall be designed with a minimum 5 psi
cushion at the furthest sprinkler head.

Amend Section 903.3.1.2 to read as follows:

903.3.1.2 NFPA 13R sprinkler systems. Automatic sprinkler systems in Group R occupancies up to and
including four stories in height in buildings not exceeding 60 feet (18 288 mm) in height above grade
plane shall be permitted to be installed throughout in accordance with NFPA 13R.

The number of stories of Group R occupancies constructed in accordance with Sections 510.2 and 510.4
of the International Building Code shall be measured from the horizontal assembly creating separate
buildings. The sprinkler system shall be designed with a minimum 5 psi cushion at the furthest sprinkler
head.

Amend Section 903.3.1.3 to read as follows:

903.3.1.3 NFPA 13D sprinkler systems. Automatic sprinkler systems installed in one- and two-family
dwellings; Group R-3; Group R-4, Condition 1; and townhouses

shall be permitted to be installed throughout in accordance with NFPA 13D. The sprinkler system shall
be designed with a minimum 5 psi cushion at the furthest sprinkler head.

Amend Section 903.4.2 to read as follows:

903.4.2 Alarms. An approved audible/visual device with a blue lens, located on the exterior of the building
in an approved location on the closest exterior fagade facing and parallel to the street, shall be connected
to each automatic sprinkler system. Such sprinkler waterflow alarm devices shall be activated by water
flow equivalent to the flow of a single sprinkler of the smallest orifice size installed in the system. Where
a fire alarm system is installed, actuation of the automatic sprinkler system shall actuate the building fire
alarm system. Existing exterior alarm bells shall be replaced with an approved audible/visible device
within one year of the date of adoption of this Code.

Amend Section 903.4.2.1 to read as follows:

903.4.2.1 Alarms in Dwelling Units. In one- and two-family dwellings, multi-family dwelling units in
buildings without common interior paths of egress, and townhouses a six-inch water flow bell shall be
installed on the interior return air plenum of the forced air furnace, or other approved location, to serve
every living space and a horn/strobe notification device shall be installed on the exterior front of the
building in an approved location visible from the street.

Amend Section 905.3.1 to read as follows and retain all exceptions:

905.3.1 Height. Class | standpipe systems shall be installed throughout buildings where the floor level of
the highest story is located more than 30 feet (9144 mm), or two stories, above the lowest level of Fire
Department access, or where the floor level of the lowest story is located more than 30 feet (9144 mm),
or two stories, below the highest level of Fire Department vehicle access or where any portion of the
floor area is more than 200 feet (61 m) of travel distance from the nearest point of Fire Department
vehicle access.

Delete Section 907.2.7 exception 2 in its entirety and substitute the following:

X:\Plandev\Witt\2018 Code Upgrade\Meeting 8\Final\IFC-3 - Proposed Revisions to Amendments Previously

Approved by the BBA (Clean).docx
Page 8 of 12

Page 64 of 68



Attachment IFC-3
Fire Code — Proposed Revisions to
Amendments Previously Approved by the BBA (Clean)

49.

50.

51.

52.

53.

54.

55.

56.
57.

2. Manual fire alarm boxes are not required at the public entrance where the building is equipped
throughout with an automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 and
the occupant notification appliances will automatically activate throughout the notification zones
upon sprinkler water flow.

Delete Section 907.2.10 in its entirety and substitute the following:

907.2.10 Single- and multiple-station smoke alarms. Listed single- and multiple-station smoke alarms
complying with UL 217 shall be installed in accordance with Sections 907.2.10.1 through 907.2.10.8,
NFPA 72, and (425 ILCS 60/) Smoke Detector Act.

Amend Section 907.2.10.1 to add the following:

4. Within 15 feet of every room used for sleeping purposes. The detector shall be installed on the
ceiling and at least 6 inches from any wall, or on a wall located between 4 and 6 inches from the
ceiling.

Delete condition number 1 under Section 907.2.10.2 in its entirety and replace with the following:

1. Within 15 feet of every room used for sleeping purposes. The detector shall be installed on the
ceiling and at least 6 inches from any wall, or on a wall located between 4 and 6 inches from the
ceiling.

Add a new Section 907.2.10.8 to read as follows:

907.2.10.8 Structures with more than one dwelling unit and mixed-use structures. Every structure which
(1) contains more than one dwelling unit, or (2) contains at least one dwelling unit and is a mixed-use
structure, shall contain at least one approved smoke detector at the uppermost ceiling of each interior
stairwell. The detector shall be installed on the ceiling, at least 6 inches from the wall, or on a wall
located between 4 and 6 inches from the ceiling.

Add a new Section 907.2.24 to read as follows:

907.2.24 C5 Zoning District: An automatic fire alarm and detection system shall be installed in all new
buildings and structures in the C5 Zoning District. By the end of the first full calendar year after the date
of adoption of this code, an automatic fire alarm and detection system shall be installed in all existing
buildings within the C5 Zoning District in accordance with NFPA 72.

Delete Section 907.4.3 in its entirety and substitute the following:

907.4.3 Automatic Smoke Detection. Where an automatic smoke detection system is required, it shall
utilize smoke detectors unless ambient conditions prohibit such an installation. In spaces where smoke
detectors cannot be utilized due to ambient conditions and in common corridors and rooms exceeding
100 square feet, approved automatic heat detectors shall be required.

Add Section 907.5.2.3.3 to read as follows:

907.5.2.3.3 Exterior visible alarms. An approved audible/visual device with a clear lens (white light),
located on the exterior of the building in an approved location on the closest exterior fagade facing and
parallel to the street, shall be connected to each fire alarm and detection system in new installations.
An exterior audible/visible device shall be installed on existing buildings equipped with a fire alarm and
detection system within one year of the date of adoption of this Code.

Delete Section 907.5.3 in its entirety.

Renumber Section 907.7.5.2 to Section 907.6.6.3 and amend to read as follows:

X:\Plandev\Witt\2018 Code Upgrade\Meeting 8\Final\IFC-3 - Proposed Revisions to Amendments Previously

Approved by the BBA (Clean).docx
Page 9 of 12

Page 65 of 68



Attachment IFC-3
Fire Code — Proposed Revisions to
Amendments Previously Approved by the BBA (Clean)

907.6.6.3 Monitoring station. All fire alarm systems shall report to an approved third-party monitoring
station.

Exception: In buildings serving occupancy group A or group E the fire alarm system shall be directly
connected to the DuPage Public Safety Communications (DU-COMM) facility (remote station) in
accordance with NFPA.

58. Delete Section 1103.5 in its entirety and substitute the following:

1103.5 Sprinkler Systems. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided in existing buildings in
accordance with Sections 1103.5.1 through 1103.5.5.

59. Renumber Section 4603.4.3 to Section 1103.5.5 and amend to read as follows:
1103.5.5 Additions To Existing Buildings And Structures.

1. In buildings of use group A, B, E, M, R, F, H, |, or S, an approved automatic sprinkler system shall
be provided throughout the addition if the gross floor area of the addition exceeds 2,500 square
feet, or throughout the addition and the existing building if the combined gross floor area of the
addition and the existing building exceeds 5,000 square feet.

2. In buildings of use group A, B, E, M, R, F, H, |, or S, and in one- and two-family dwellings and
townhouses, an approved automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout the addition
and throughout the existing building or if the gross floor area of the addition exceeds 150% of the
gross floor area of the existing building.

3. In existing buildings and structures where the modification factor as determined in Section
1103.5.9 is equal to or greater than 1.25.

60. Renumber Section 4603.4.4 to Section 1103.5.6 and amend to read as follows:
1103.5.6 Alterations To Existing Buildings And Structures.

1. In buildings of use group A, B, E, M, R, F, H, |, or S, an approved automatic sprinkler system shall
be provided throughout the existing building and any addition if the structurally altered existing
exterior wall and roof gross square foot area exceeds 50% of the total existing exterior wall and
roof gross square foot area.

2. In one- and two-family dwellings and townhouses, an approved automatic sprinkler system shall
be provided throughout the existing building and any addition if the structurally altered existing
exterior wall and roof gross square foot area exceeds 75% of the total existing exterior wall and
roof gross square foot area.

3. In existing buildings and structures where the modification factor as determined in Section
1103.5.9 is equal to or greater than 1.25.

61. Renumber Section 4603.4.5 to Section 1103.5.7 and amend to read as follows:
1103.5.7 Remodeling In Existing Buildings and Structures.

1. In buildings of all occupancy groups, except group U and one- and two-family dwellings and
townhouses, an approved automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout the
remodeled interior area if the hard cost of all remodeling work exceeds $1,000,000 or 25% of the
market value of the building or structure.

X:\Plandev\Witt\2018 Code Upgrade\Meeting 8\Final\IFC-3 - Proposed Revisions to Amendments Previously
Approved by the BBA (Clean).docx
Page 10 of 12

Page 66 of 68



Attachment IFC-3
Fire Code — Proposed Revisions to
Amendments Previously Approved by the BBA (Clean)

62.

63.

64.

65.

2. In one and two family dwellings and townhouses, an approved automatic sprinkler system shall
be provided throughout the remodeled interior area of the existing building if the hard cost of all
remodeling work exceeds $300,000.

3. In existing buildings and structures where the modification factor as determined in Section
1103.5.9 is equal to or greater than 1.25.

Add a new Section 1103.5.8 to read as follows:

1103.5.8 Cumulative effect of modifications. When calculating the gross floor area, exterior wall areas,
and gross roof area under Sections 1103.5.5 and 1103.5.6, and the hard cost under Section 1103.5.7,
the calculated values shall include all work to be performed on the existing building or structure under
consideration as part of the permit application, plus all work performed on the existing building or
structure within the two-year period of time immediately prior to the date of the current permit
application.

Add a new Section 1103.5.9 to read as follows:

1103.5.9 Building and structures modification factor. In addition to the requirements set forth in
Sections, 1103.5.5, 1103.5.6 and 1103.5.7. an approved automatic sprinkler system shall be installed
throughout existing buildings and structures where the modification factor M, determined in
accordance with the following, is equal to or greater than 1.25.

M = modification factor where,

Aaddition = gross square foot floor area of addition

Aatteration = gross square foot area of structurally altered exterior walls and roof
Saddition = hard cost of addition

Efioor = gross floor area of existing building or structure

Esurface = gross area of existing exterior walls and roof

Sthreshold = $300,000

M = Aaddition / Efloor + Aalteration / Esurface + Saddition / Sthreshold

The hard cost of the addition is established as 0.85 times the square foot area of all habitable levels of
the addition times the most current building valuation cost for single-family homes of Type VA
construction as published by the International Code Council.

Exception: Single-family dwellings less than 1,500 square feet in gross floor area shall not be subject to
the modification factor.

Add a new Section 1103.5.10 to read as follows:

1103.5.10 Residential basement remodeling. When the hard cost of basement remodeling in one- and
two-family dwellings and townhouses exceeds $15,000, a sprinkler head shall be installed on the
domestic water line within 5 feet of any boiler, furnace or clothes dryer.

Renumber Section 4603.5 to Section 1103.6 and amend to read as follows:

1103.6 Standpipes. Class | Standpipes shall be provided in all existing buildings and structures in use
group A, B, E, M, R, F, H, | or S and installed in accordance with section 905 where any one of the
following conditions exist:

X:\Plandev\Witt\2018 Code Upgrade\Meeting 8\Final\IFC-3 - Proposed Revisions to Amendments Previously

Approved by the BBA (Clean).docx
Page 11 of 12

Page 67 of 68



Attachment IFC-3
Fire Code — Proposed Revisions to
Amendments Previously Approved by the BBA (Clean)

66.
67.

68.

69.

1.  The existing building is enlarged to exceed two stories or where any portion of the floor area
exceeds two hundred feet (200') from the nearest Fire Department access.

2.  The existing building is enlarged and the gross floor area of the addition exceeds 150% of the
gross floor area of the existing building or structure.

3.  The existing building is altered and the structurally altered exterior wall and roof gross area
exceeds 75% of the existing total exterior wall and roof gross area.

4, The existing building is remodeled and the hard cost of the remodeled area exceeds $1,000,000
or 25% of the market value of the building or structure.

Exception: Standpipes shall not be required in one- and two-family dwellings and townhouses.
Delete Sections 1103.6.1, and 1103.6.2 in their entirety.
Renumber Section 4603.6 to Section 1103.7 and amend to read as follows:

1103.7 Fire Alarm Systems. An approved fire alarm system shall be installed in existing buildings and
structures in accordance with Sections 1103.7.1 through 1103.7.6 and provide occupant notification in
accordance with section 907.6 unless other requirements are provided by other sections of this Code.

Exception: Occupancies with an existing, previously approved fire alarm system.
Amend Section 1103.7.6 to read as follows and maintain the Exceptions:

1103.7.6 Group R-2. A manual fire alarm system that activates the occupant notification system in
accordance with Section 907.5 shall be installed in existing R-2 occupancies more than three stories in
height or with more than 12 dwelling or sleeping units. The detection device shall be a heat detector
which shall be installed in the main living room. Smoke detectors or other alarm or detection devices
installed within the dwelling or sleeping unit shall not be tied into the building’s occupant notification
system.

Add Section 1103.7.7 to read as follows:

1103.7.7 Group A, B, E, M, R, F, H, | And S. An approved fire alarm system installed in accordance with
the provisions of this Code and NFPA 72 shall be provided under any one of the following conditions:

1.  The existing building is enlarged or the gross floor area is increased and the hard cost of the
construction work exceeds $15,000.

2. The existing building is altered and the hard cost of the construction work to structurally alter the
exterior wall and roof exceeds $15,000.

3.  The existing building is remodeled and the hard cost of the interior construction work exceeds
$15,000.

Exception: Fire alarm systems shall not be required in one- and two-family dwellings and townhouses.

(Ord. 5893, 10-25-2010, eff. 12-1-2010; Ord. 5918, 1-24-2011; Ord. 6603, 5-29-2018)

X:\Plandev\Witt\2018 Code Upgrade\Meeting 8\Final\IFC-3 - Proposed Revisions to Amendments Previously

Approved by the BBA (Clean).docx
Page 12 of 12

Page 68 of 68



	A. Call to Order: 7:00 p.m.
	B. Roll Call
	C. Public Comments (Non-agenda Items)
	D. Approval of Draft Minutes
	1) Draft Minutes of Regular Meeting - 05/18/22
	Building Board of Appeals Draft Minutes 05/18/22
	5-18-22 BBA Meeting Minutes - Draft


	E. Old Business
	F. New Business
	1) Review of codes regulating construction for potential adoption
	Building Board of Appeals Item Packet
	Staff Report - Building Codes Upgrade Meeting 8 - 061522
	Attachment - A - Crains Chicago Business Chicago Construction Costs Third Highest in Country
	Attachment - B - ICC Building Valuation Data - August 2021
	Attachment - C - Turner & Townsend International Construction Market Survey 2019
	Attachment - D - NAHB Cost of Constructing a Home
	Attachment - E - Calculation of Project Hard Cost
	Attachment - F - Fire Sprinkler Modification Factor Analysis - 060722
	IFC-2 - Proposed Revisions to Amendments Previously Approved by the BBA (Redlined)
	IFC-3 - Proposed Revisions to Amendments Previously Approved by the BBA (Clean)


	G. Trustee Report
	H. Chairman's Report
	I. Staff Liaison's Report
	J. Next Meeting Date:  TBD
	K. Adjournment

